

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

Material Sh Text Qty. at Base Unit	Quant. Bidden Coll. No.	Belgian Audio IFBMM12015	Neopart IFBMM12015	New Flyer IFBMM12015	Muncie Transit Supply IFBMM12015	Gilling IFBMM12015	Demier IFBMM12015	Prevost IFBMM12015	MCI IFBMM12015	Nabi IFBMM12015
2544-016-0021 INSERT-SEAT BACK, BLUE 179 EA	Item 3 Val.: Price: Rank:	5,907.00 33.00	6,827.06 38.14	8,448.80 47.2	8,046.05 44.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2544-016-0023 INSERT-SEAT BACK, BLUE 179 EA	Item 3 Val.: Price: Rank:	6,086.00 34.00	7,065.13 39.47	8,660.02 48.38	8,448.80 47.2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2544-016-0022 INSERT-SEAT BOTTOM, VI 702 EA	Item 4 Val.: Price: Rank:	23,100.00 34.00	26,774.28 38.14	33,050.16 47.08	31,905.80 45.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2544-016-0022 INSERT-SEAT BOTTOM, VI 702 EA	Item 4 Val.: Price: Rank:	24,170.00 35.00	27,707.94 39.47	33,871.50 48.25	33,499.44 47.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<p>I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p>										
<p>Contract Administrator 1</p> <p>Manager of Procurement</p>										



FINAL BID ABSTRACT

Material Sh Text	Quot. Bidder Cdn No.:	Receipt IFBMM12015	Gilling IFBMM12015	Diameter IFBMM12015	Prevoist IFBMM12015	MCI IFBMM12015	Natr IFBMM12015	Bergen Auto IFBMM12015	New Flyer IFBMM12015	Muncie Transit Supply IFBMM12015
2210-003-0010 BELT-WHEELCHAIR 11 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	695.0 89.5	1,034.66 94.06	1,500.40 136.4	1,567.50 142.5	1,767.48 160.68	1,022.01 92.91	1,232.00 112	1,012.55 92.05	1,319.45 119.95
2210-003-0010 BELT-WHEELCHAIR 11 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	1,020.14 82.74	1,066.56 86.96	1,500.40 136.4	1,611.50 146.5	1,855.92 168.72	1,075.80 97.8	1,232.00 112	1,037.74 94.34	1,385.45 125.95
2210-003-0012 KIT-SEAT BELT, WHEELCH 130 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	21,989.90 169.23	23,203.70 178.49	33,644.00 258.8	35,100.00 270	37,157.90 285.63	22,917.70 176.29	26,000.00 200	22,704.90 174.65	28,593.50 219.95
2210-003-0012 KIT-SEAT BELT, WHEELCH 130 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	22,769.90 175.15	23,921.30 184.01	33,644.00 258.8	36,010.00 277	39,016.90 300.13	24,124.10 185.97	26,650.00 205	23,271.30 179.01	30,023.50 230.95
2544-004-0008 COVER, HEAD REST (PASS 14 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	126.14 0.01	132.3 9.45	191.94 13.71	200.2 14.3	242.48 17.32	132.3 9.45	175 12.5	129.92 9.28	174.86 12.49
2544-004-0008 COVER, HEAD REST (PASS 14 IEA	Val.: Price: Rank:	131.18 9.07	136.36 9.74	191.94 13.71	247.8 17.7	254.66 16.19	139.3 9.95	182 13	133.14 9.51	183.54 13.11
<p>I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.</p> <p><i>Shayna Binkley</i>                  Central Administrator I</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p><i>Steph J. Hany</i>                  Manager of Procurement</p>										