

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT
SOLICITATION NO. IB1200022
BID OPENING: 5-8-2012 TIME: 2:30PM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCILLA ABBS

NO	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11	12	13	14
		5000LBS. ELE FORKLIFT "A"	8000LBS. ELE FORKLIFT "B"	8000LBS DIESEL FORKLIFT "C"	1500LBS DIESEL FORKLIFT "D"	BACKHOE/LOADER TRACTOR "E"	DIESEL POWER YR TUG "F"	DIESEL RIDER TYPE YR SCRUBBER "G"	DIESEL RIDER TYPE TYPE SWEEPER "H"	GENIE BOOM LIFT "I"	SCISSOR LIFT "J"	ORDER PICKER "K"	ELEC POWERED STOCK CHASER "L"	WALK BEHIND FL SCRUBBER "M"	FOUR WHEEL ELEC BURDEN CARRIER N
1.	NILFISH-ADVANCE, INC. PLYMOUTH, MN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$34,805.80	\$47,850.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,425.00	NO BID
2.	CRT INDUSTRIAL EQUIPMENT, INC HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50,161.00	\$57,435.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11,108.00	NO BID
3.	MUSTANG CATERPILLAR HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$74,548.96	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.	CURRUTH-DOGGETT EQUIPMENT- TOYOTA LIFT OF HOUSTON HOUSTON, TX	* \$28,591.00	* \$49,669.00	* \$36,385.00	* \$59,188.00	NO BID	\$40,943.00	NO BID	\$46,893.00	\$54,737.00	\$10,960.00	\$24,047.00	\$5,911.00	\$7,269.00	\$7,506.00
5.	BROOKSIDE EQUIPMENT SALES, INC. HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$37,738.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.	SUBFIN WHOLESALE COMMODITIES HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	** \$31,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.	BRIGGS EQUIPMENT HOUSTON, TX	\$29,127.55	\$46,586.08	\$37,826.83	\$66,178.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$109,357.00	\$61,597.00	\$55,369.00	\$11,173.00	\$20,758.10	\$6,797.00	\$10,412.00	\$12,977.00
8.	MITSUBISHI FORKLIFT TRUCKS OF HOUSTON HOUSTON, TX	* \$26,887.55	NO BID	* \$38,936.56	* \$62,298.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$30,906.96	\$4,423.48	\$10,500.00	\$8,385.24

Note * Bidders could not comply with Buy America as required.

Note** Bidder could not honor the price and withdrew the bid.

Item 1-4 and 6 will be rebid.

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Justina M. Jackson
Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Mark S. ...
Manager of Procurement