

IFBMM13015

Bidder: Performance Truck

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO Part Number	Estimated Quantity For One Year	UOM	Unit Bid Price	Total Bid Price
1	FILTER ELEMENT (ORION DPF)	CUMMINS ORION	4965287NX G0502661BJ	2710-009-0013	24	EACH	\$1,474.82	\$35,395.68
2	MODULE, PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS ORION	2871462 H0774535AK 23530045	2710-048-1001	2	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
3	MUFFLER CATALYTIC	DETROIT DIESEL NEW FLYER NELSON MUFFLER MFG.	217356 28661A 253257	2815-028-0103	28	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
4	MUFFLER ASSEMBLY, C6.3	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES INC CUMMINS EMISSION SOLUTIONS BOYER	29916N-10 201698A-10	2815-028-0116	54	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
5	FILLER SECTION, EXHAUST (NF HYBRID)	CUMMINS NEW FLYER	G619725A-10 6348614	2815-530-0001	5	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
6	MODULE, DIESEL PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS	Q229747	2815-541-0001	7	EACH	No Bid	No Bid

IFBMM13015

Bidder: Muncie Transit Supply

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO Part Number	Estimated Quantity For One Year	UOM	Unit Bid Price	Total Bid Price
1	FILTER ELEMENT (ORION DPF)	CUMMINS ORION	4965287NX G0502561BJ	2710-009-0013	24	EACH	\$2,279.33	\$54,703.92
2	MODULE, PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS ORION	2871462 H0774535AK 23530045	2710-048-1001	2	EACH	\$2,449.83	\$4,899.66
3	MUFFLER CATALYTIC	DETROIT DIESEL NEW FLYER NELSON MUFFLER MFG.	217356 28661A 253257	2815-028-0103	28	EACH	\$5,995.00	\$167,860.00
4	MUFFLER ASSEMBLY, C8.3	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES INC CUMMINS EMISSION SOLUTIONS BOYER	29916N-10 201698A-10	2815-028-0116	54	EACH	\$4,395.00	\$237,330.00
5	FILLER SECTION, EXHAUST (NF HYBRID)	CUMMINS NEW FLYER	Q619725A-10 6348614	2815-530-0001	5	EACH	\$7,169.35	\$35,846.75
6	MODULE, DIESEL PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS	Q229747	2815-541-0001	7	EACH	\$319.95	\$2,239.65

IFBMM13015

Bidder: New Flyer Industries

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO Part Number	Estimated Quantity For One Year	UOM	Unit Bid Price	Total Bid Price
1	FILTER ELEMENT (ORION DPF)	CUMMINS ORION	4965287NX G30502561BJ	2710-009-0013	24	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
2	MODULE, PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS ORION	2871462 H0774535AK Z3530045	2710-048-1001	2	EACH	\$2,295.88	\$4,591.76
3	MUFFLER CATALYTIC	DETROIT DIESEL NEW FLYER NELSON MUFFLER MFG.	217356 28661A 253257	2815-028-0103	28	EACH	\$4,186.69	\$117,227.32
4	MUFFLER ASSEMBLY, C8.3	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES INC CUMMINS EMISSION SOLUTIONS BOYER	29916N-10 201698A-10	2815-028-0116	54	EACH	\$2,493.22	\$134,633.88
5	FILLER SECTION, EXHAUST (NF HYBRID)	CUMMINS NEW FLYER	Q619725A-10 6348614	2815-530-0001	5	EACH	\$10,667.77	\$53,338.85
6	MODULE, DIESEL PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS	Q229747	2815-541-0001	7	EACH	\$289.48	\$2,026.36

IFBMM13015

Bidder: Cummins Southern Plains

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO Part Number	Estimated Quantity For One Year	UOM	Unit Bid Price	Total Bid Price
1	FILTER ELEMENT (ORION DPF)	CUMMINS ORION	4965287NX G0502561BJ	2710-009-0013	24	EACH	\$1,452.20	\$34,852.80
2	MODULE, PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS ORION	2871462 H0774535AK	2710-048-1001	2	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
3	MUFFLER CATALYTIC	DETROIT DIESEL NEW FLYER NELSON MUFFLER MFG.	23530045 217356 28661A 253257	2815-028-0103	28	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
4	MUFFLER ASSEMBLY, C8.3	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES INC CUMMINS EMISSION SOLUTIONS	29916N-10 201698A-10	2815-028-0116	54	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
5	FILLER SECTION, EXHAUST (NF HYBRID)	CUMMINS NEW FLYER	Q619725A-10 6348614	2815-530-0001	5	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
6	MODULE, DIESEL PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS	Q229747	2815-541-0001	7	EACH	\$361.83	\$2,532.81

IFBMM13015

Bidder: Stewart & Stevenson

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO Part Number	Estimated Quantity For One Year	UOM	Unit Bid Price	Total Bid Price
1	FILTER ELEMENT (ORION DPF)	CUMMINS ORION	4965287NX G0502561BJ	2710-009-0013	24	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
2	MODULE, PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS ORION	2871462 H0774535AK 23530045	2710-048-1001	2	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
3	MUFFLER CATALYTIC	DETROIT DIESEL NEW FLYER NELSON MUFFLER MFG.	217356 28661A 253257	2815-028-0103	28	EACH	\$3,187.10	\$89,238.80
4	MUFFLER ASSEMBLY, C8.3	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES INC CUMMINS EMISSION SOLUTIONS	29916N-10 201698A-10	2815-028-0116	54	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
5	FILLER SECTION, EXHAUST (NF HYBRID)	CUMMINS NEW FLYER	Q619725A-10 6348614	2815-530-0001	5	EACH	No Bid	No Bid
6	MODULE, DIESEL PARTICULATE FILTER	CUMMINS	Q229747	2815-541-0001	7	EACH	No Bid	No Bid