

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT

IFB NO. IB1300011

BID OPENING: 1 - 29 -2013

TIME: 2:30PM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCILLA ABBS

| NO. | NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER | ITEM NO. 1 | ITEM NO. 2 | ITEM NO. 3 | REMARKS |
|-----|--|--|---|------------------------|---------|
| | | UNIT PRICE 8000LBS DIESEL FORKLIFT | UNIT PRICE 15000LBS DIESEL FORKLIFT | UNIT PRICE YARD TUG | |
| 1. | DOOSAN SUWANEE, GA | \$45,418.00 | \$63,046.00 | NO BID | |
| 2. | RICHMOND EQUIPMENT RICHMOND, TX | NO BID | NO BID | \$40,073.44 | |
| 3. | MITSUBISHI HOUSTON, TX | \$38,936.96 | \$63,940.88 | NO BID | |
| 4. | TCB SERVICES HOUSTON, TX | \$47,240.00 | \$94,340.00 | \$48,595.00 | |
| 5. | BRIGGS EQUIPMENT HOUSTON, TX | \$35,829.93 | \$65,462.43 | NO BID | |
| 6. | SUBFIN WHOLESALE COMMODITIES HOUSTON, TX | \$52,050.00 | \$78,076.00 | NO BID | |
| 7. | EQUIPMENT DEPOT HOUSTON, TX | \$40,079.00 | \$61,170.00 | \$47,781.00 | |
| 8. | CARRUTH-DOGGETT INC dba TOYOTA LIFT OF HOUSTON HOUSTON, TX | Would not Hold Price \$35,537.00 | \$64,287.00 | \$40,943.00 | |
| 9. | | | | | |
| 10. | | | | | |

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Quanita M. Jackson
Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Michael S. ...
Manager of Procurement