

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF KONI SHOCK ABSORBERS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO. IFBMM13023

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/16/2013 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	REMARKS								
		Item 1	Item 3	Item 4	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9			
1.	GILLIG, LLC. HAYWARD, CA.	\$35,434.00	\$9,516.56	\$9,516.56	\$14,376.08	\$4,657.04	\$8,992.13			
2.	NABI, INC. DELAWARE, OH.	\$49,000.00	NO BID	\$16,450.47	\$24,850.71	\$8,050.23	\$11,714.64			
3.	NEW FLYER WINNIPEG, CANADA	\$39,060.00	\$11,812.04	\$12,610.10	\$26,882.02	\$8,708.26	\$11,113.48			
4.	MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	\$57,382.50	\$15,411.30	\$15,411.30	\$23,280.90	\$7,541.70	\$11,710.65			
5.	NEOPART, LLC. HONEY BROOK, PA.	\$39,161.50	\$12,147.62	\$12,147.62	\$18,350.66	\$5,944.58	\$9,278.08			
6.	MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY NILES, ILLINOIS	\$42,019.25	\$15,787.77	\$15,787.77	NO BID	NO BID	\$9,889.88			
7.										
8.										
9.										
10.										

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

[Signature]
Contract Administrator I

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

[Signature]
Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF KONI SHOCK ABSORBERS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO. IFBMM13023

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/16/2013 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	REMARKS	
		Item 2	Item 10
1.	NEW FLYER WINNIPEG, CANADA	\$21,366.18	\$228.80
2.	GILLIG, LLC. HAYWARD, CA.	\$24,500.08	\$249.70
3.	NABI, INC. DELAWARE, OH.	\$33,880.00	NO BID
4.	MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	\$39,675.90	\$288.20
5.	NEOPART, LLC. HONEY BROOK, PA.	\$27,077.38	NO BID
6.	MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY NILES, ILLINOIS	\$29,053.31	NO BID
7.			
8.			
9.			
10.			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

[Signature]
Contract Administrator I

[Signature]
Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF KONI SHOCK ABSORBERS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO. IFBMM13023

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/16/2013 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	REMARKS	
		item 5	item 6
1.	MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY NILES, ILLINOIS	\$20,026.00	\$22,382.00
2.	GILLIG, LLC. HAYWARD, CA.	\$21,210.05	\$23,705.35
3.	NEW FLYER WINNIPEG, CANADA	\$22,805.50	\$26,123.10
4.	MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN.	\$27,871.50	\$31,150.50
5.	NEOPART, LLC. HONEY BROOK, PA.	\$21,969.10	\$24,553.70
6.	NABI, INC. DELAWARE, OH.	\$29,750.85	\$33,250.95
7.			
8.			
9.			
10.			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Andy Shales
Contract Administrator

Jim J. [Signature]
Manager of Procurement

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: NEW FLYER

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	175	EACH	111.6	19530	111.6	19530	39060
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	EACH	88.29	10683.09	88.29	10683.09	21366.18
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	EACH	125.66	5906.02	125.66	5906.02	11812.04
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRONT, MCI	KONI	90-2586	2530-116-0051	47	EACH	134.15	6305.05	134.15	6305.05	12610.1
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR (MCI)	KONI	90-2587	2530-116-0052	85	EACH	134.15	11402.75	134.15	11402.75	22805.5
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2589	2530-116-0053	95	EACH	137.49	13061.55	137.49	13061.55	26123.1
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	71	EACH	189.31	13441.01	189.31	13441.01	26882.02
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	23	EACH	189.31	4354.13	189.31	4354.13	8708.26
9	KIT-SHOCK, ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	133	EACH	41.78	5556.74	41.78	5556.74	11113.48
10	BUSHING-SHOCK, ABSORBER, UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15 23 31 122 D	2530-411-0001	22	EACH	5.2	114.4	5.2	114.4	228.8

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: GILLIG, LLC.

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	175	EACH	98.77	17284.75	103.71	18149.25	35434
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	EACH	98.77	11951.17	103.71	12548.91	24500.08
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	EACH	98.77	4642.19	103.71	4874.37	9516.56
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT, MCI	KONI	90-2586	2530-116-0051	47	EACH	98.77	4642.19	103.71	4874.37	9516.56
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR (MCI)	KONI	90-2587	2530-116-0052	85	EACH	121.72	10346.2	127.81	10863.85	21210.05
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2589	2530-116-0053	95	EACH	121.72	11563.4	127.81	12141.95	23705.35
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2683	2530-116-0055	71	EACH	98.77	7012.87	103.71	7363.41	14376.08
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2684	2530-116-0056	23	EACH	98.77	2271.71	103.71	2385.33	4657.04
9	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	133	EACH	33.68	4479.44	33.93	4512.69	8992.13
10	BUSHING-SHOCK ABSORBER,UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15,23,31,122,0	2530-411-0001	22	EACH	5.56	122.32	5.79	127.38	249.7

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: NABI, INC.

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	175	EACH	136.41	23871.75	143.59	25126.25	49000
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK-REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	EACH	136.41	16505.61	143.59	17374.39	33880
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT, MCI	KONI	90-2586	2530-116-0051	47	EACH	170.52	8014.44	179.49	8436.03	16450.47
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (MCI)	KONI	90-2587	2530-116-0052	85	EACH	170.52	14494.2	179.49	15256.65	29750.85
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2589	2530-116-0053	95	EACH	170.52	16199.4	179.49	17051.55	33250.95
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	71	EACH	170.52	12106.92	179.49	12745.79	24850.71
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	23	EACH	170.52	3921.96	179.49	4128.27	8050.23
9	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	133	EACH	42.91	5707.03	45.17	6007.61	11714.64
10	BUSHING-SHOCK ABSORBER UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15 25 31 122 0	2530-411-0001	22	EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: NEOPART, LLC.

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
						Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK-FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5065SP2	2530-116-0037	175	109.7	19197.5	114.08	19964	39161.5
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK-REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	109.7	13273.7	114.08	13803.68	27077.38
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	126.7	5954.9	131.76	6192.72	12147.62
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT, MCI	KONI	90-2686	2530-116-0051	47	126.7	5954.9	131.76	6192.72	12147.62
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK REAR (MCI)	KONI	90-2687	2530-116-0052	85	126.7	10769.5	131.76	11199.6	21969.1
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2689	2530-116-0053	95	126.7	12036.5	131.76	12517.2	24553.7
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	71	126.7	8995.7	131.76	9354.96	18350.66
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	23	126.7	2914.1	131.76	3030.48	5944.58
9	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-259-0002	133	34.2	4548.6	35.56	4729.48	9278.08
10	BUSHING-SHOCK ABSORBER UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15,233.311.122.0	2530-411-0001	22		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: MUNCIE

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	UDM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK-FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5065SP2	2530-116-0037	175	EACH	159.95	27991.25	167.95	29391.25	57382.5
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK-REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	EACH	159.95	19353.95	167.95	20321.95	39675.9
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	EACH	159.95	7517.65	167.95	7893.65	15411.3
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK-FRONT, MCI	KONI	90-2586	2530-116-0051	47	EACH	159.95	7517.65	167.95	7893.65	15411.3
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK-REAR (MCI)	KONI	90-2587	2530-116-0052	85	EACH	159.95	13595.75	167.95	14275.75	27871.5
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2588	2530-116-0053	95	EACH	159.95	15195.25	167.95	15955.25	31150.5
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	71	EACH	159.95	11356.45	167.95	11924.45	23280.9
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	23	EACH	159.95	3678.85	167.95	3862.85	7541.7
9	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	133	EACH	42.95	5712.35	45.1	5998.3	11710.65
10	BUSHING-SHOCK ABSORBER-UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15-23-31-122-0	2530-411-0001	22	EACH	6.39	140.58	6.71	147.62	288.2

IFBMM13023

BIDDER: MOHAWK

Item No	Material Description	Manufacturer	Part Number	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	175	EACH	117.7	20597.5	122.41	21421.75	42019.25
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	121	EACH	117.7	14241.7	122.41	14811.61	29053.31
3	SHOCK-KONI	KONI	90-2472SP1	2530-116-0050	47	EACH	164.66	7739.02	171.25	8048.75	15787.77
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT. MCI	KONI	90-2586	2530-116-0051	47	EACH	164.66	7739.02	171.25	8048.75	15787.77
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK REAR (MC)	KONI	90-2587	2530-116-0052	85	EACH	115.49	9816.65	120.11	10209.35	20026
6	ABSORBER-SHOCK TAG	KONI	90-2589	2530-116-0053	95	EACH	115.49	10971.55	120.11	11410.45	22382
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT. ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	71	EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	23	EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-256-0002	133	EACH	36.45	4847.85	37.91	5042.03	9889.88
10	BUSHING-SHOCK ABSORBER UPPER DRIVE AXLE	KONI	15.23.31.122.0	2530-411-0001	22	EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID