

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF ELECTRIC FORKLIFTS AND
BOOM LIFTS

IFB NO. IB1300028

BID OPENING: 5 - 23 -2013

TIME: 2:30PM

RECORDED BY: RHONDA FRANKLIN

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	ITEM NO. 1	ITEM NO. 2	ITEM NO. 3	REMARKS
		UNIT PRICE 5000LBS ELECTRIC FORKLIFT	UNIT PRICE 8000LBS ELECTRIC FORKLIFT	UNIT PRICE BOOM LIFT	
1.	APEX PINNACLE PORT CRANE, NEW YORK	NO BID	NO BID	\$63,333.00	
2.	ONE SOURCE EQUIPMENT THROCK MORTON, TEXAS	NO BID	NO BID	\$55,433.00	
3.	CROWN LIFT TRUCKS HOUSTON, TEXAS	\$27,733.19	\$43,468.93	\$57,895.79	ITEM NO. 2 WRONG POWER SYSTEM
4.	DAILY EQUIPMENT CO. HOUSTON, TEXAS	\$42,531.38	\$62,179.09	NO BID	
5.	BRIGGS EQUIPMENT HOUSTON, TEXAS	\$27,811.50	\$44,612.00	\$56,130.00	
6.	VOLVO RENTS OCEANSIDE, CALIFORNIA	NO BID	NO BID	\$62,173.34	
7.	OLYMPIC EQUIPMENT RENTALS (OER) PALATINE, ILLINOIS	\$26,272.00	\$54,823.50	\$53,414.02	ITEM NO. 1 DIDN'T COMPLY WITH BUY AMERICA
8.	EQUIPMENT DEPOT HOUSTON, TEXAS	\$14,310.63	\$33,024.78	\$8,726.57	WITHDREW BID
9.	TOYOTA LIFT OF HOUSTON HOUSTON, TEXAS	\$27,606.00	\$51,006.00	\$55,755.00	
10.					

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Jessita M. Jackson
Contract Administrator

Michael Southwell
Manager of Procurement