

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PAVEMENT REHABILITATION OF HIRAM CLARKE, KASHMERE,
POLK AND NORTHWEST BUS OPERATING FACILITIES (BOF)

IFB NO. IB1300044

BID OPENING: 7 - 25 -2013

TIME: 3:00PM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCILLA ABBS

NO	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDERS	TOTAL AMOUNT HIRAM CLARKE	TOTAL AMOUNT KASHMERE	TOTAL AMOUNT POLK	TOTAL AMOUNT NORTHWEST	REMARKS
1	CORESTONE CONSTRUCTION SERVICE TOMBALL, TX	\$470,670.55	\$355,135.00	\$260,573.17	\$396,371.06	
2	GOLDSHIRE DEVELOPERS, LLC SUGAR LAND, TX	\$657,117.56	\$417,604.75	\$324,906.19	\$366,440.40	
3	MITCHELL CONTRACTING HOUSTON, TX	\$522,012.13	\$396,637.56	\$313,081.97	\$387,909.72	
4	W.A. ROBBINS CONSTRUCTION INC. PEARLAND, TX	NO BID	\$1,852,122.00	NON-RESPONSIVE \$125,455.20	\$1,581,225.20	
5	NELSON CONSTRUCTION ROSENBERG, TX	\$392,520.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NON-RESPONSIVE
6						
7						
8						
9						
10						

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.


Contract Administrator


Manager of Procurement