

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF NIEHOFF ALTERNATORS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM14007
OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/20/2014 @ 10:00AM

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	GROUP 1 (1 Year Warranty)		GROUP 2 (2 Year Warranty)		REMARKS
		TOTAL BID PRICE Item 1	TOTAL BID PRICE Item 2	TOTAL BID PRICE Item 1	TOTAL BID PRICE Item 2	
1.	B&C Truck Electric Kansas City, MO 64108	\$22,267.18	\$183,888.45	\$22,267.18	\$183,888.45	
2.	Texas Alternators Austin Tx 78753	\$22,902.49	\$188,074.45	\$22,902.49	\$188,074.45	
3.	Alternator Service Dallas Tx 75212	\$24,635.00	\$206,425.00	\$37,635.00	\$321,425.00	
4.	Wood Alternator Houston Texas 77037	\$25,285.00	\$211,830.00	\$38,415.00	\$327,980.00	
5.	Prevost Elgin ILL 60123	\$27,885.00	\$226,550.00	\$28,721.55	\$233,346.50	
6.	NABI Delaware OH 43015	\$25,062.31	\$205,810.90	\$25,062.31	\$205,810.90	
7.	New Flyer Winnipeg Canada R2J4G5	\$28,542.54	\$223,910.75	\$28,542.54	\$223,910.75	
8.	Battery Systems Garden Grove CA 92841	\$31,886.40	\$263,108.50	No Bid	No bid	
9.	Gillig Hayward CA 94545	\$25,370.28	\$208,339.75	No Bid	No bid	
10.	Eireg Buffalo NY 14207	\$25,855.44	\$216,292.00	No Bid	No bid	
11.	MCI Louisville Kentucky 40258	No Bid	No bid	\$26,312.00	\$224,250.00	

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement