

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF INVENTORY BUS FLUIDS

IFB NO. IB1400024
 BID OPENING: 5-20-2014
 TIME: 3:00PM

RECORDED BY: JENNIFER ROBINSON

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 1 ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 2 TRANSMISSION FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 3 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 4 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 CJ-4	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 5 GEAR OIL	REMARKS
1.	RELADYNE/THE HURT COMPANY HOUSTON, TX	\$123,026.00	\$250,969.00	\$93,383.00	\$359,646.00	\$83,356.00	
2.	SUN COAST RESOURCES, INC HOUSTON, TX	\$136,838.00	\$340,864.00	\$124,066.00	\$343,558.00	\$88,247.00	
3.	UNIVERSAL LUBRICANTS WICHITA, KS	NO BID	\$285,035.00	\$186,766.00	\$474,339.00	\$85,285.00	NON RESPONSIVE
4.	ZXP TECHNOLOGIES HIGHLANDS, TX	\$145,391.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$345,115.00	\$99,000.00	
5.	THREE L INC. HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	\$240,245.00	NO BID	\$417,771.00	\$102,176.00	
6.	MARTIN ENERGY SERVICES HOUSTON, TX	\$223,645.00 NON RESPONSIVE	NO BID	\$163,211.00	\$411,024.00 NON RESPONSIVE	\$118,831.00	
7.	J.A.M. EQUIPMENT HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$388,709.00	\$128,672.00	
8.	QUALITY STANDARD PETROLEUM HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$337,330.00	\$82,051.00	NON RESPONSIVE
9.	APACHE OIL CO. PASADENA, TX	\$267,290.00	\$257,593.00	\$138,073.00	\$309,306.00	\$85,854.00	
10.	ARGUNDEGUI OIL COMPANY LAREDO, TX	\$181,311.00	\$488,375.00	\$94,717.00	\$334,217.00	\$81,865.00	

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Contract Administrator

Manager of Procurement