

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FLAT GLASS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM14023
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 10/22/2014 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: DON MURPHY

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM								REMARKS
		Item 2	Item 5	Item 6	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	Item 11	
1.	MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. Louisville, KY	\$968.00	\$7,073.00	\$1,990.02	\$2,244.74	\$20,556.30	\$24,106.56	\$1,724.49	\$1,796.55	
2.	BINSWANGER GLASS Houston, TX	\$1,780.52	\$12,387.20	\$445.13	\$3,863.60	\$34,289.40	\$44,552.16	\$3,997.88	No Bid	Non Responsive Item No. 6
3.	TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC. Elizabeth, NJ	\$1,618.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
5.	APPLE GLASS COMPANY Houston, TX	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
6.										
7.										
8.										
9.										
10.										

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.



Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.



Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FLAT GLASS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM14023
 BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 10/22/2014 @ 10:00AM
 RECORDED BY: DON MURPHY

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID		REMARKS
		Item 3	Item 4	
1.	TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC. Elizabeth, NJ	\$3,476.20	\$1,527.00	
2.	MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. Louisville, KY	\$5,534.48	\$2,755.74	
3.	BINSWANGER GLASS Houston, TX	\$11,106.62	\$4,759.98	
4.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	No Bid	No Bid	
5.	APPLE GLASS COMPANY Houston, TX	No Bid	No Bid	
6.				
7.				
8.				
9.				
10.				

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.


 Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.


 Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FLAT GLASS FOR TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM14023
 BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 10/22/2014 @ 10:00AM
 RECORDED BY: DON MURPHY

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID	REMARKS
		AMOUNT BY ITEM Item 1	
1.	APPLE GLASS COMPANY Houston, TX	\$3,960.00	
2.	TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC. Elizabeth, NJ	\$4,879.80	
3.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$8,268.12	
4.	MCI SERVICE PARTS, INC. Louisville, KY	\$8,762.58	
5.	BINSWANGER GLASS Houston, TX	\$17,873.46	
6.			
7.			
8.			
9.			
10.			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr Contract Administrator



I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

