

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF INVENTORY BUS FLUIDS

IFB NO. IB1500034
BID OPENING: 6-2-2015

TIME: 3:00PM

RECORDED BY: JENNIFER ROBINSON

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 1 ANTIFREEZE/COOLANT	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 2 TRANSMISSION FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 3 DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 4 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 CJ-4	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 5 GEAR OIL	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 6 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 API CF-4	REMARKS
1.	LUBE MARK HIGHLANDS, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$300,000.00	\$71,701.00	NO BID*	
2.	THREE L INC. HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	\$274,558.00	NO BID	\$416,334.00	\$99,792.00	\$33,445.00*	
3.	MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY GAINESVILLE, GA	NO BID	NO BID	\$220,075.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID*	
4.	ADVANCE AUTO PARTS HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	\$439,653.00	\$678,825.00	\$492,268.00	\$28,699.00 NON RESPONSIVE	\$32,120.00*	
5.	RELADYNE HOUSTON, TX	\$121,699.00	\$325,736.00	\$209,475.00 SEE SOP	\$282,269.00	\$80,805.00	\$32,119.00*	
6.	ARGUNDEGUI OIL COMPANY LAREDO, TX	NO BID	NO BID	\$209,475.00 SEE SOP	\$295,361.00	\$75,842.00	\$24,470.00*	
7.	ICP, LLC CUT & SHOOT, TX	\$246,678.00	\$133,546.00 NON RESPONSIVE	\$229,950.00	\$330,448.00	\$71,366.00 NON RESPONSIVE	NO BID*	
8.	BLENDER DIRECT HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$374,438.00	\$77,658.00	\$26,678.00*	
9.	APACHE OIL CO. PASADENA, TX	NO BID	\$281,426.00	NO BID	\$255,561.00	\$85,578.00	\$57,152.00*	
10.	SUN COAST RESOURCES, INC LAREDO, TX	\$126,249.00	NO BID	\$214,200.00	\$285,411.00	\$87,226.00	\$23,989.00*	
11.	SUBFIN WHOLESALE COMMODITIES HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$379,675.00	NO BID	\$32,850.00*	
12.	HIGHTOWERS PETROLEUM CO. MIDDLETOWN, OH	NO BID	NO BID	\$283,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID*	

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Contract Administrator

Manager of Procurement

*METRO will not be awarding a Contract for CNG Engine Oil SAE 15W-40 API CF-4 due to technical specification discrepancies.