

VENDOR: GILLIG LLC

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	152	Each	\$99.75	\$15,162.00	\$103.41	\$15,718.32	\$30,880.32
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	65	Each	\$99.75	\$6,483.75	\$103.41	\$6,721.65	\$13,205.40
3	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT,(A MCI)	KONI	90-3032	2530-116-0051	51	Each	\$98.77	\$5,037.27	\$102.28	\$5,216.28	\$10,253.55
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (B AXLE MCI)	KONI	90-3033SP1	2530-116-0052	115	Each	\$102.00	\$11,730.00	\$106.93	\$12,296.95	\$24,026.95
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, TAG MCI 4800, 4900, 5000	KONI	90-3082	2530-116-0053	76	Each	\$113.00	\$8,588.00	\$117.70	\$8,945.20	\$17,533.20
6	ABSORTBER SHOCK TAG AXLE STEER	CONTROL PRODUCTS	654789	2530-116-0054	27	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	155	Each	\$108.00	\$16,740.00	\$114.76	\$17,787.80	\$34,527.80
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	2	Each	\$101.50	\$203.00	\$105.73	\$211.46	\$414.46
9	ABSORBER, SHOCK (FRONT)	SACHS	48170000499	2530-116-0061	32	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	ABSORBER, SHOCK (REAR SUSPENSION)	SACHS	48170000492	2530-116-0062	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	SHOCK, MIDDLE AXLE	SACHS	481700005953	2530-116-0063	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	ABSORBER, SHOCK	SACHS	481700005952	2530-116-0064	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	99	Each	\$34.80	\$3,445.20	\$38.24	\$3,785.76	\$7,230.96
14	ABSORBER-SHOCK (NABI Bus)	KONI	90-2184	2530-116-0015	30	Each	\$114.00	\$3,420.00	\$122.00	\$3,660.00	\$7,080.00

VENDOR: MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	152	Each	\$185.07	\$28,130.64	\$194.32	\$29,536.64	\$57,667.28
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	65	Each	\$185.07	\$12,029.55	\$194.32	\$12,630.80	\$24,660.35
3	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT,(A MCI)	KONI	90-3032	2530-116-0051	51	Each	\$185.07	\$9,438.57	\$194.32	\$9,910.32	\$19,348.89
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (B AXLE MCI)	KONI	90-3033SP1	2530-116-0052	115	Each	\$185.07	\$21,283.05	\$194.32	\$22,346.80	\$43,629.85
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, TAG MCI 4800, 4900, 5000	KONI	90-3082	2530-116-0053	76	Each	\$185.07	\$14,065.32	\$194.32	\$14,768.32	\$28,833.64
6	ABSORTBER SHOCK TAG AXLE STEER	CONTROL PRODUCTS	654789	2530-116-0054	27	Each	\$35.35	\$954.45	\$37.12	\$1,002.24	\$1,956.69
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	155	Each	\$185.07	\$28,685.85	\$194.32	\$30,119.60	\$58,805.45
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	2	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	ABSORBER, SHOCK (FRONT)	SACHS	481700000499	2530-116-0061	32	Each	\$67.89	\$2,172.48	\$71.28	\$2,280.96	\$4,453.44
10	ABSORBER, SHOCK (REAR SUSPENSION)	SACHS	481700000492	2530-116-0062	30	Each	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$68.25	\$2,047.50	\$3,997.50
11	SHOCK, MIDDLE AXLE	SACHS	481700005953	2530-116-0063	30	Each	\$66.17	\$1,985.10	\$69.48	\$2,084.40	\$4,069.50
12	ABSORBER, SHOCK	SACHS	481700005952	2530-116-0064	30	Each	\$65.00	\$1,950.00	\$68.25	\$2,047.50	\$3,997.50
13	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	99	Each	\$52.52	\$5,199.48	\$55.15	\$5,459.85	\$10,659.33
14	ABSORBER-SHOCK (NABI Bus)	KONI	90-2184	2530-116-0015	30	Each	\$185.07	\$5,552.10	\$194.32	\$5,829.60	\$11,381.70

VENDOR: NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	152	Each	\$108.45	\$16,484.40	\$108.45	\$16,484.40	\$32,968.80
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	65	Each	\$87.27	\$5,672.55	\$87.27	\$5,672.55	\$11,345.10
3	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT,(A MCI)	KONI	90-3032	2530-116-0051	51	Each	\$126.40	\$6,446.40	\$126.40	\$6,446.40	\$12,892.80
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (B AXLE MCI)	KONI	90-3033SP1	2530-116-0052	115	Each	\$180.56	\$20,764.40	\$180.56	\$20,764.40	\$41,528.80
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, TAG MCI 4800, 4900, 5000	KONI	90-3082	2530-116-0053	76	Each	\$180.56	\$13,722.56	\$180.56	\$13,722.56	\$27,445.12
6	ABSORTBER SHOCK TAG AXLE STEER	CONTROL PRODUCTS	654789	2530-116-0054	27	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	155	Each	\$180.56	\$27,986.80	\$180.56	\$27,986.80	\$55,973.60
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	2	Each	\$144.32	\$288.64	\$144.32	\$288.64	\$577.28
9	ABSORBER, SHOCK (FRONT)	SACHS	481700000499	2530-116-0061	32	Each	\$79.14	\$2,532.48	\$79.14	\$2,532.48	\$5,064.96
10	ABSORBER, SHOCK (REAR SUSPENSION)	SACHS	481700000492	2530-116-0062	30	Each	\$83.92	\$2,517.60	\$83.92	\$2,517.60	\$5,035.20
11	SHOCK, MIDDLE AXLE	SACHS	481700005953	2530-116-0063	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	ABSORBER, SHOCK	SACHS	481700005952	2530-116-0064	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	KIT-SHOCK ABSORBER FRONT	KONI	1387	2530-258-0002	99	Each	\$33.75	\$3,341.25	\$33.75	\$3,341.25	\$6,682.50
14	ABSORBER-SHOCK (NABI Bus)	KONI	90-2184	2530-116-0015	30	Each	\$126.17	\$3,785.10	\$126.17	\$3,785.10	\$7,570.20

VENDOR: CBM US INC

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period		Contract Period		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							First Year		Second Year		
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	152	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	65	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT,(A MCI)	KONI	90-3032	2530-116-0051	51	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (B AXLE MCI)	KONI	90-3033SP1	2530-116-0052	115	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, TAG MCI 4800, 4900, 5000	KONI	90-3082	2530-116-0053	76	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	ABSORTBER SHOCK TAG AXLE STEER	CONTROL PRODUCTS	654789	2530-116-0054	27	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	155	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	2	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	ABSORBER, SHOCK (FRONT)	SACHS	481700000499	2530-116-0061	32	Each	\$64.98	\$2,079.36	\$64.98	\$2,079.36	\$4,158.72
10	ABSORBER, SHOCK (REAR SUSPENSION)	SACHS	481700000492	2530-116-0062	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	SHOCK, MIDDLE AXLE	SACHS	481700005953	2530-116-0063	30	Each	\$63.52	\$1,905.60	\$63.52	\$1,905.60	\$3,811.20

VENDOR: MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	ABSORBER-SHOCK,FRNT SUSPENSION	KONI	90-5055SP2	2530-116-0037	152	Each	\$124.70	\$18,954.40	\$127.90	\$19,440.80	\$38,395.20
2	ABSORBER-SHOCK,REAR SUSPENSION	KONI	90-2102SP1	2530-116-0039	65	Each	\$124.70	\$8,105.50	\$127.90	\$8,313.50	\$16,419.00
3	ABSORBER-SHOCK FRONT,(A MCI)	KONI	90-3032	2530-116-0051	51	Each	\$124.70	\$6,359.70	\$127.90	\$6,522.90	\$12,882.60
4	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR (B AXLE MCI)	KONI	90-3033SP1	2530-116-0052	115	Each	\$124.70	\$14,340.50	\$127.90	\$14,708.50	\$29,049.00
5	ABSORBER-SHOCK, TAG MCI 4800, 4900, 5000	KONI	90-3082	2530-116-0053	76	Each	\$124.70	\$9,477.20	\$127.90	\$9,720.40	\$19,197.60
6	ABSORTBER SHOCK TAG AXLE STEER	CONTROL PRODUCTS	654789	2530-116-0054	27	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	ABSORBER-SHOCK, FRONT, ORION	KONI	90-2693	2530-116-0055	155	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	ABSORBER-SHOCK, REAR	KONI	90-2694	2530-116-0056	2	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	ABSORBER, SHOCK (FRONT)	SACHS	481700000499	2530-116-0061	32	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	ABSORBER, SHOCK (REAR SUSPENSION)	SACHS	481700000492	2530-116-0062	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	SHOCK, MIDDLE AXLE	SACHS	481700005953	2530-116-0063	30	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid