

VENDOR: GILLIG LLC

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR,FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	187	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	FIRESTONE	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$118.16	\$22,686.72	\$124.06	\$23,819.52	\$46,506.24
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR,FRONT, FOR"	GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$84.67	\$16,510.65	\$88.90	\$17,335.50	\$33,846.15
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE	W01-882-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$93.67	\$38,779.38	\$98.35	\$40,716.90	\$79,496.28
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$122.51	\$67,993.05	\$128.63	\$71,389.65	\$139,382.70
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

VENDOR: MAC HAIK FORD

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	\$201.15	\$19,310.40	\$201.15	\$19,310.40	\$38,620.80
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	\$203.17	\$3,860.23	\$203.17	\$3,860.23	\$7,720.46
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR,FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	\$218.17	\$7,854.12	\$218.17	\$7,854.12	\$15,708.24
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	187	Each	\$156.08	\$29,186.96	\$156.08	\$29,186.96	\$58,373.92
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$144.49	\$27,742.08	\$144.49	\$27,742.08	\$55,484.16
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR,FRONT, FOR"	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$155.89	\$30,398.55	\$155.89	\$30,398.55	\$60,797.10
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-682-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$167.33	\$69,274.62	\$167.33	\$69,274.62	\$138,549.24
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$137.75	\$76,451.25	\$137.75	\$76,451.25	\$152,902.50
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	\$200.12	\$18,010.80	\$200.12	\$18,010.80	\$36,021.60

VENDOR: MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	\$142.32	\$2,704.08	\$146.59	\$2,785.21	\$5,489.29
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR,FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	\$117.70	\$4,237.20	\$121.23	\$4,364.28	\$8,601.48
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	187	Each	\$122.18	\$22,847.66	\$125.85	\$23,533.95	\$46,381.61
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$69.92	\$13,424.64	\$72.02	\$13,827.84	\$27,252.48
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR,FRONT, FOR"	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$80.00	\$15,600.00	\$82.40	\$16,068.00	\$31,668.00
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-682-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$80.00	\$33,120.00	\$82.40	\$34,113.60	\$67,233.60
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$127.71	\$70,879.05	\$131.54	\$73,004.70	\$143,883.75
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	\$151.09	\$13,598.10	\$155.62	\$14,005.80	\$27,603.90

A. Schedule of Items and Prices
 Bidder agrees to furnish all resources necessary to supply and deliver (F.O.B. Destination) the following items at the below bid prices:

VENDOR: SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	\$146.86	\$14,098.56	\$146.86	\$14,098.56	\$28,197.12
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	\$135.60	\$2,576.40	\$135.60	\$2,576.40	\$5,152.80
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR, FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	\$159.36	\$5,736.96	\$159.36	\$5,736.96	\$11,473.92
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	FIRESTONE	W01-653-9571	2510-154-0031	187	Each	\$119.19	\$22,288.53	\$119.19	\$22,288.53	\$44,577.06
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9127	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$129.42	\$24,848.64	\$129.42	\$24,848.64	\$49,697.28
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR, FRONT, FOR"	GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$119.05	\$23,214.75	\$119.05	\$23,214.75	\$46,429.50
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	GOODYEAR	W01-682-8263	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$115.39	\$47,771.46	\$115.39	\$47,771.46	\$95,542.92
8	BAG, AIR	GOODYEAR	W01-358-8616	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$105.19	\$58,380.45	\$105.19	\$58,380.45	\$116,760.90
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	\$152.18	\$13,696.20	\$152.18	\$13,696.20	\$27,392.40

A. Schedule of Items and Prices
 Bidder agrees to furnish all resources necessary to supply and deliver (F.O.B. Destination) the following items at the below bid prices:

VENDOR: NEOPART, LLC

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	\$100.78	\$9,674.88	\$105.82	\$10,158.72	\$19,833.60
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2530-342-0001	19	Each	\$135.03	\$2,565.57	\$141.79	\$2,694.01	\$5,259.58
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR,FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	\$111.67	\$4,020.12	\$117.26	\$4,221.36	\$8,241.48
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	187	Each	\$105.34	\$19,698.58	\$110.61	\$20,684.07	\$40,382.65
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$63.45	\$12,182.40	\$66.63	\$12,792.96	\$24,975.36
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR,FRONT, FOR"	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$76.32	\$14,882.40	\$80.14	\$15,627.30	\$30,509.70
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-682-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$72.36	\$29,957.04	\$75.98	\$31,455.72	\$61,412.76
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$113.79	\$63,153.45	\$119.48	\$66,311.40	\$129,464.85
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

VENDOR: NEW FLYER

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-286	2510-025-0102	96	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	\$148.62	\$2,823.78	\$148.62	\$2,823.78	\$5,647.56
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR, FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	\$122.91	\$4,424.76	\$122.91	\$4,424.76	\$8,849.52
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	187	Each	\$127.59	\$23,859.33	\$127.59	\$23,859.33	\$47,718.66
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$62.64	\$12,026.88	\$62.64	\$12,026.88	\$24,053.76
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR, FRONT, FOR"	GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$82.53	\$16,093.35	\$82.53	\$16,093.35	\$32,186.70
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION) 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE	W01-882-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$93.42	\$38,675.88	\$93.42	\$38,675.88	\$77,351.76
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$130.13	\$72,222.15	\$130.13	\$72,222.15	\$144,444.30
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	\$119.07	\$10,716.30	\$119.07	\$10,716.30	\$21,432.60

VENDOR: NABI PARTS, LLC

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	AIR RIDE - FRONT/ REAR 6 PER BUS (NABI)	GOODYEAR	1R11-266	2510-025-0102	96	Each	\$138.22	\$13,269.12	\$145.49	\$13,967.04	\$27,236.16
2	BAG, AIR - REAR SUSPENSION (METRO-LIFT)	FIRESTONE	W01-358-5702	2535-342-0001	19	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3	BELLOW ASM-AIR, FRONT	FIRESTONE	W01-653-8827	2530-325-0002	36	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4	BELLOW ASM-FRT/DRIVE/TRL	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-653-9571 1R12-396	2510-154-0031	167	Each	\$77.44	\$14,481.28	\$81.52	\$15,244.24	\$29,725.52
5	SPRING-AIR RIDE, SUSPENSION, R	FIRESTONE	W01-W35-9127 1R12-512	2510-025-0087	192	Each	\$68.31	\$13,115.52	\$71.91	\$13,806.72	\$26,922.24
6	"BELLOW ASSEMBLY-AIR, FRONT, FOR"	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-W35-9465 1R11-179	2510-154-0020	195	Each	\$76.45	\$14,907.75	\$80.47	\$15,691.65	\$30,599.40
7	BAG-AIR, REAR AXLE (ORION), 128 OPRN	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-682-8263 1R12-539	2530-440-0002	414	Each	\$79.68	\$32,987.52	\$83.87	\$34,722.18	\$67,709.70
8	BAG, AIR	FIRESTONE GOODYEAR	W01-358-8616 1R11-249	2530-440-0001	555	Each	\$96.92	\$53,790.60	\$102.02	\$56,621.10	\$110,411.70
9	BAG-AIR, REAR SUSPENSION (NOVA)	GOODYEAR	1R11-232	2530-440-0004	90	Each	\$96.41	\$8,676.90	\$101.48	\$9,133.20	\$17,810.10