

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S
 TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012
 BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM
 BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT		REMARKS
		BY ITEM	Item 40	
1.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA		\$11,734.00	
2.	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA		\$11,802.48	
3.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY		\$12,212.96	
4.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA		\$16,546.88	
5.	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX		\$17,338.68	
6.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC Elgin, IL		\$25,623.66	
7.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada		\$29,746.66	
8.				
9.				
10.				

I certify that I have personally opened and read
 all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated
 herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012
BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM			REMARKS
		Item 36	Item 42	Item 43	
1.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY	\$13,810.59	\$2,603.62	\$1,964.16	
2.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA	\$13,833.00	\$3,839.10	\$2,643.20	
3.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC Elgin, IL	\$14,236.65	\$3,392.21	\$3,732.48	
4.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA	\$18,384.66	\$4,180.80	\$3,174.40	
5.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$18,943.65	\$9,116.02	\$3,381.12	
6	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA	\$26,931.69	\$3,338.61	\$2,390.40	
7	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX	No Bid	\$5,313.77	\$4,109.44	
8					
9					

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012
BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM					REMARKS
		Item 1	Item 4	Item 5	Item 7	Item 41	
1.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA	\$5,668.40	\$5,092.20	\$10,824.12	\$23,476.20	\$2,081.52	
2.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC Elgin, IL	\$13,790.64	\$8,314.80	\$14,717.85	\$36,792.80	\$4,578.84	
3.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA	\$16,132.00	\$7,539.90	\$17,606.85	\$29,260.00	\$3,420.90	
4.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY	\$16,529.38	\$7,724.40	\$17,539.44	\$29,164.30	\$3,923.01	
5.	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA	\$20,838.40	\$7,352.94	\$15,655.17	\$26,547.95	\$2,840.04	
6	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX	\$24,647.92	\$7,945.80	\$21,750.96	\$41,690.00	\$5,734.89	
7	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$43,872.38	\$14,730.48	\$20,200.53	\$39,735.85	\$5,465.88	
8							
9							

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012
 BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM
 BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM
 RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEMS		REMARKS
		Item 12	Item 25	
1.	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX	\$5,054.95	\$26,646.30	
2.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$5,323.38	\$72,980.88	
3.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC. Elgin, IL	\$5,878.77	\$59,535.00	
4.	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA	\$7,126.57	\$29,973.00	
5.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY	\$7,633.00	\$31,251.72	
6.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA	\$7,684.00	\$30,732.00	
7.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA	\$9,345.58	\$42,030.60	
8.				
9.				
10.				

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012

BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEMS																				REMARKS	
		Item 6	Item 9	Item 10	Item 13	Item 14	Item 16	Item 18	Item 20	Item 22	Item 23	Item 24	Item 26	Item 27	Item 29	Item 30	Item 31	Item 33	Item 35	Item 37	Item 38		Item 39
1.	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA	\$21,699.09	\$4,911.16	\$12,282.80	\$10,174.99	\$18,374.76	\$2,570.10	\$3,800.10	\$50,938.80	\$12,496.41	\$9,879.64	\$2,782.03	\$6,195.82	\$3,140.90	\$2,407.50	\$3,591.83	\$42,814.41	\$3,943.64	\$2,296.35	\$4,226.80	\$5,181.28	\$7,912.64	
2.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA	\$21,805.00	\$6,506.52	\$16,521.60	\$15,065.12	\$23,816.88	\$3,192.00	\$5,047.56	\$74,720.40	\$16,808.40	\$13,288.04	\$3,593.44	\$8,123.96	\$4,202.80	\$3,149.40	\$4,710.42	\$62,018.60	\$5,238.08	\$3,329.20	\$5,840.00	\$6,740.74	No Bid	
3.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC Elgin, IL	\$28,826.21	\$6,350.76	\$12,960.00	\$12,615.75	No Bid	\$5,163.90	\$4,112.79	\$109,350.00	\$14,944.50	\$11,866.46	\$3,352.20	\$6,240.70	\$3,544.10	\$2,747.70	\$4,400.44	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,971.95	\$5,581.00	\$7,994.70	\$14,754.82	
4.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA	\$34,140.40	\$5,144.80	\$13,560.00	\$12,019.00	\$19,710.00	\$2,619.00	\$4,257.00	\$56,160.00	\$14,148.00	\$10,906.00	\$2,948.90	\$6,669.10	\$3,370.50	\$2,585.25	\$3,751.00	\$47,957.00	\$4,176.00	\$2,570.00	\$5,320.00	\$5,475.50	\$11,330.60	
5.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY	\$34,937.84	\$5,306.46	\$13,492.80	\$12,303.27	\$20,184.12	\$2,607.30	\$4,122.09	\$60,631.00	\$13,629.87	\$10,852.28	\$2,933.73	\$6,636.12	\$3,357.20	\$2,572.50	\$3,847.03	\$46,113.74	\$4,291.12	\$2,501.00	\$5,477.60	\$5,639.53	\$14,013.01	
6.	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$36,925.21	\$13,636.08	\$33,197.80	\$22,953.42	\$49,425.30	\$6,286.20	\$7,909.11	\$134,977.00	\$34,306.02	\$25,796.38	\$7,078.10	\$17,036.72	\$4,261.60	\$5,107.05	\$9,494.76	\$117,626.40	\$10,543.24	\$5,768.85	\$8,076.80	\$10,250.70	\$25,712.95	
7.	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX	\$39,230.31	\$7,467.04	\$19,350.40	\$12,066.25	\$23,965.20	\$3,664.50	\$4,157.70	\$73,911.80	\$18,214.83	\$15,036.12	\$4,125.13	\$9,060.32	\$4,471.60	\$3,616.50	\$5,199.37	\$64,411.49	\$5,773.40	\$3,362.50	\$8,474.00	\$5,397.01	\$19,055.44	
8.																							
9.																							

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF ZF TRANSMISSION PARTS FOR METRO'S TRANSIT VEHICLES

SOLICITATION NO.: IFBMM16012
 BID DUE DATE/TIME: 02/10/2016 @ 2:00 PM
 BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 02/11/2016 @ 10:00AM


RECORDED BY: Prinscilla Abbs

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEMS											REMARKS	
		Item 2	Item 3	Item 8	Item 11	Item 15	Item 17	Item 19	Item 21	Item 28	Item 32	Item 34		Item 44
1.	PREVOST CAR (US), INC Elgin, IL	\$19,376.64	\$7,650.86	\$2,936.25	\$48,800.88	\$32,744.25	\$5,062.50	\$16,742.70	\$4,133.80	\$6,196.23	\$28,504.40	\$4,252.50	\$3,823.36	
2.	CBM US, INC. Cambridge, MA	\$21,478.32	\$10,712.52	\$3,054.57	\$71,294.60	\$42,089.46	\$5,356.00	\$18,629.00	\$6,054.40	\$8,390.25	\$68,808.20	\$4,329.85	\$4,592.64	
3.	SELECTIVE TRANSIT PARTS, INC. San Carlos, CA	\$28,080.00	\$12,096.00	\$3,772.90	\$76,160.00	\$41,328.00	\$6,000.00	\$19,656.00	\$4,560.00	\$8,856.00	\$73,860.00	\$6,146.00	\$5,006.40	
4.	NATSCO TRANSIT SOLUTIONS, INC. Marcy, NY	\$28,754.64	\$12,034.96	\$3,860.19	\$78,097.32	\$41,126.61	\$6,295.50	\$19,593.08	\$7,139.00	\$9,076.86	\$75,818.60	\$6,321.42	\$4,998.40	
5.	NEOPART, LLC Honey Brook, PA	\$35,208.00	\$14,736.96	\$4,725.26	\$95,622.96	\$50,358.00	\$7,756.50	\$20,037.16	\$8,068.00	\$11,114.82	\$92,550.00	\$7,435.40	\$5,120.00	
6	CUMMINS SOUTHERN PLAINS, LLC Arlington, TX	\$39,284.64	\$12,213.18	\$4,507.76	\$61,469.96	\$56,290.29	\$7,851.00	\$26,392.08	\$9,263.00	\$13,018.59	\$104,682.20	\$7,749.70	\$5,040.96	
7	NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES CANADA, ULC Winnipeg, Manitoba, Canada	\$69,926.40	\$22,947.82	No Bid	\$53,901.90	\$102,796.68	\$14,337.50	\$48,197.50	No Bid	\$23,774.31	\$191,169.20	\$13,295.45	\$4,804.80	
8														
9														
10														

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.


 Sr. Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.


 Manager of Procurement