

MOHAWK MFG. & SUPPLY COMPANY

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|---------------------------------------|---|------------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 1 | CLUTCH-FIELD, A/C, 24V, TK, ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 45-1965 G1340598EX | 2540-004-0002 | 50 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 2 | INSULATION-CURBSIDE | THERMO KING CORP | 33-2407 | 2540-025-0013 | 2 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 3 | MOTOR-CONDENSER, A/C 27V | THERMO KING CORP | 104-652 | 2540-050-0012 | 68 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 4 | MOTOR-CONDENSER FAN | THERMO KING CORP GILLIG | 78-1460 82-65470-019 | 2540-050-0016 | 59 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 5 | MODULE - MAIN INTELLIGIAIRE | THERMO KING CORP | 419353 | 2540-057-0008 | 27 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 6 | MOULE - DISPLAY INTELLIGIAIRE III (NO | THERMO KING CORP | 45-2339 | 2540-057-0010 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 7 | DRIVERS MODULE-A/C EVAP MOTORS | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3590 | 2540-057-1003 | 7 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 8 | DEHYDRATOR-AIR/COND | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK SPORLAN VALVE | 306-221 25-631-990 C-41E3 | 2540-064-0005 | 47 | EACH | \$85.74 | \$4,029.78 | \$89.16 | \$4,190.52 | \$8,220.30 |
| 9 | MOTOR ASSEMBLY , EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING ORION | 104-741 G134598FY | 2540-108-0016 | 6 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 10 | MOTOR, CONDENSOR (BRUSHLESS) C | THERMO KING ORION | 104-740 G1340598FM | 2540-114-0015 | 41 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 11 | COMPRESSOR - A/C X640 T/K (NOVA) N | THERMO KING CORP | 102-657 | 2540-124-0007 | 23 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 12 | BLOWER-A/C EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING CORP | 78-1461 | 2540-141-0015 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 13 | PULLEY-A/C COMPRESSOR,8"DIA., | THERMO KING CORP ORION | 77-1414 H1310513AE | 2540-151-0003 | 12 | EACH | \$248.32 | \$2,979.84 | \$258.25 | \$3,099.00 | \$6,078.84 |
| 14 | PULLEY-A/C COMP TK, 8"DIA 2 GROOV | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 77-1672 97-5453-168 | 2540-151-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$228.89 | \$2,060.01 | \$238.05 | \$2,142.45 | \$4,202.46 |
| 15 | PULLEY, 2.5 B-GROOVE (ORION) | THERMO KING ORION MOHAWK | 77-1752 G1340598EY 16G-2-357 | 2540-151-0046 | 43 | EACH | \$256.88 | \$11,045.84 | \$267.15 | \$11,487.45 | \$22,533.29 |
| 16 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 107-431 97-6505-266 | 2540-189-0003 | 64 | EACH | \$371.98 | \$23,806.72 | \$386.85 | \$24,758.40 | \$48,565.12 |
| 17 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR 24V | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES ORION | 6310860 H1330507AB 107-432 | 2540-189-0004 | 9 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 18 | FIELD,CLUTCH(24VDC W/2PIN TOWER | THERMO KING CORP | H1310513AD 45-2031 | 2540-205-0016 | 10 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 19 | CLUTCH ASSEMBLY - A/C (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 107-415 | 2540-205-0019 | 36 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 20 | VALVE-EPR | THERMO KING ORION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-5136 F1340513AL 6321856 | 2540-265-0014 | 3 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 21 | SWITCH-LOW PRESSURE | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 44-8734 6315542 | 2540-289-0003 | 6 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 22 | HOSE ASSY DISCHARGE-20, STEEL | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-9686 136732 | 2540-325-0002 | 81 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 23 | TRANSDUCER - PRESSURE | THERMO KING CORP | 41-5781 | 2540-345-0002 | 14 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 24 | FILTER, AIR | THERMO KING CORP | 130658 | 2710-006-0064 | 23 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 25 | FOAM - ANTI SLOSH (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 33-4680 | 2710-061-0001 | 154 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 26 | HOSE, A/C - #24 ST-45 22.13" LONG | THERMO KING CORP | ORION 081337423 61-4888 | 4720-036-0161 | 45 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|----------------------------------|---|-----------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 27 | HOSE-DISCHARGE, NOVA | THERMO KING CORP | 61-2972 | 4720-036-0167 | 3 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 28 | VALVE, EXPANSION (R-407c) | THERMO KING CORP | 61-5328 | 4810-003-0009 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 29 | VALVE-CHECK,HOSE | THERMO KING CORP | 66-1273 | 4810-017-0010 | 557 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 30 | VALVE-SOLENOID, A/C HOT WATER | THERMO KING CORP NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-7599 6329442 | 4820-026-0002 | 22 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 31 | SCREW, BODY (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 51-2096 | 5305-027-0065 | 38 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 32 | SEAL ASSY-COMP, CRANKSHAFT | THERMO KING CORP | 22-778 | 5330-015-0008 | 16 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 33 | SEAL-CRANKSHAFT A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 22-1100 | 5330-015-0053 | 19 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 34 | SWITCH-HIGH PRESSURE CUT OUT, | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES MOHAWK | 44-7814 6310985 97-2751-152 | 5930-006-0003 | 20 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 35 | SWITCH- A/C HIGH PRESSURE (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 41-4486 | 5930-006-0005 | 17 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 36 | RELAY-24V,40/30 AMP | THERMO KING MOHAWK NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-896 87-248-2 6321783 | 5945-021-0013 | 214 | EACH | \$5.58 | \$1,194.12 | \$5.80 | \$1,241.20 | \$2,435.32 |
| 37 | BRUSH-SET EVAP. & COND.MTR. | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 44-4435 G1014330 | 5977-011-0001 | 233 | EACH | \$34.18 | \$7,963.94 | \$35.54 | \$8,280.82 | \$16,244.76 |
| 38 | HARNESS, COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING ORION | 41-4810 G1340589GR | 6220-007-0311 | 30 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 39 | SENSOR-HIGH TEMP. | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-5394 6324707 | 6620-006-0014 | 15 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 40 | SENSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3345 | 6620-033-0007 | 25 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 41 | OIL-A/C COMPRESSOR, SYNTHETIC | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 67-404 97-5666-452 | 9150-008-0006 | 57 | EACH | \$39.95 | \$2,277.15 | \$41.54 | \$2,367.78 | \$4,644.93 |
| 42 | OIL, 407C - A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 2030513 | 9150-027-0001 | 147 | EACH | \$29.44 | \$4,327.68 | \$30.62 | \$4,501.14 | \$8,828.82 |

SOUTHERN COACH PARTS COMPANY

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|--|--|------------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 1 | CLUTCH-FIELD, A/C, 24V, TK, ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 45-1965 G1340598EX | 2540-004-0002 | 50 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 2 | INSULATION-CURBSIDE | THERMO KING CORP | 33-2407 | 2540-025-0013 | 2 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 3 | MOTOR-CONDENSER, A/C 27V | THERMO KING CORP | 104-652 | 2540-050-0012 | 68 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 4 | MOTOR-CONDENSER FAN | THERMO KING CORP GILLIG | 78-1460 82-65470-019 | 2540-050-0016 | 59 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 5 | MODULE - MAIN INTELLIGAIRE | THERMO KING CORP | 419353 | 2540-057-0008 | 27 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 6 | MOULE - DISPLAY INTELLIGAIRE III (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 45-2339 | 2540-057-0010 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 7 | DRIVERS MODULE-A/C EVAP MOTORS | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3590 | 2540-057-1003 | 7 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 8 | DEHYDRATOR-AIR/COND | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK SPORLAN VALVE | 306-221 25-631-990 C-41E3 | 2540-064-0005 | 47 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 9 | MOTOR ASSEMBLY , EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING ORION | 104-741 G134598FY | 2540-108-0016 | 6 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 10 | MOTOR, CONDENSOR (BRUSHLESS) ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 104-740 G1340598FM | 2540-114-0015 | 41 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 11 | COMPRESSOR - A/C X640 T/K (NOVA) NEW | THERMO KING CORP | 102-657 | 2540-124-0007 | 23 | EACH | \$2,500.00 | \$57,500.00 | \$2,650.00 | \$60,950.00 | \$118,450.00 |
| 12 | BLOWER-A/C EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING CORP | 78-1461 | 2540-141-0015 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 13 | PULLEY-A/C COMPRESSOR,8"DIA., | THERMO KING CORP ORION | 77-1414 H1310513AE | 2540-151-0003 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 14 | PULLEY-A/C COMP TK, 8"DIA 2 GROOVE | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 77-1672 97-5453-168 | 2540-151-0004 | 9 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 15 | PULLEY, 2.5 B-GROOVE (ORION) | THERMO KING ORION MOHAWK | 77-1752 G1340598EY 16G-2-357 | 2540-151-0046 | 43 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 16 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 107-431 97-6505-266 | 2540-189-0003 | 64 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 17 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR 24V | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES ORION THERMO KING | 6310860 H1330507AB 107-432 | 2540-189-0004 | 9 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 18 | FIELD,CLUTCH(24VDC W/2PIN TOWER CONNECT) | ORION THERMO KING CORP | H1310513AD 45-2031 | 2540-205-0016 | 10 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 19 | CLUTCH ASSEMBLY - A/C (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 107-415 | 2540-205-0019 | 36 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 20 | VALVE-EPR | THERMO KING ORION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-5136 F1340513AL 6321856 | 2540-265-0014 | 3 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 21 | SWITCH-LOW PRESSURE | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 44-8734 6315542 | 2540-289-0003 | 6 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 22 | HOSE ASSY DISCHARGE-20, STEEL | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-9686 136732 | 2540-325-0002 | 81 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 23 | TRANSDUCER - PRESSURE | THERMO KING CORP | 41-5781 | 2540-345-0002 | 14 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 24 | FILTER, AIR | THERMO KING CORP | 130658 | 2710-006-0064 | 23 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 25 | FOAM - ANTI SLOSH (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 33-4680 | 2710-061-0001 | 154 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 26 | HOSE, A/C - #24 ST-45 22.13" LONG | ORION THERMO KING CORP | 081337423 61-4888 | 4720-036-0161 | 45 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|----------------------------------|--|-----------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 27 | HOSE-DISCHARGE, NOVA | THERMO KING CORP | 61-2972 | 4720-036-0167 | 3 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 28 | VALVE, EXPANSION (R-407c) | THERMO KING CORP | 61-5328 | 4810-003-0009 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 29 | VALVE-CHECK,HOSE | THERMO KING CORP | 66-1273 | 4810-017-0010 | 557 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 30 | VALVE-SOLENOID, A/C HOT WATER | THERMO KING CORP NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-7599 6329442 | 4820-026-0002 | 22 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 31 | SCREW, BODY (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 51-2096 | 5305-027-0065 | 38 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 32 | SEAL ASSY-COMP. CRANKSHAFT | THERMO KING CORP | 22-778 | 5330-015-0008 | 16 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 33 | SEAL-CRANKSHAFT A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 22-1100 | 5330-015-0053 | 19 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 34 | SWITCH-HIGH PRESSURE CUT OUT, | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES MOHAWK | 44-7814 6310985 97-2751-152 | 5930-006-0003 | 20 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 35 | SWITCH- A/C HIGH PRESSURE (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 41-4486 | 5930-006-0005 | 17 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 36 | RELAY-24V,40/30 AMP | THERMO KING MOHAWK NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-896 87-248-2 6321783 | 5945-021-0013 | 214 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 37 | BRUSH-SET EVAP. & COND.MTR. | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 44-4435 G1014330 | 5977-011-0001 | 233 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 38 | HARNES, COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING ORION | 41-4810 G1340589GR | 6220-007-0311 | 30 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 39 | SENSOR-HIGH TEMP. | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-5394 6324707 | 6620-006-0014 | 15 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 40 | SENSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3345 | 6620-033-0007 | 25 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 41 | OIL-A/C COMPRESSOR, SYNTHETIC | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 67-404 97-5666-452 | 9150-008-0006 | 57 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 42 | OIL, 407C - A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 2030513 | 9150-027-0001 | 147 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO LLC dba NEW FLYER PARTS

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|--|--|------------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 1 | CLUTCH-FIELD, A/C, 24V, TK, ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 45-1965 G1340598EX | 2540-004-0002 | 50 | EACH | \$425.00 | \$21,250.00 | \$425.00 | \$21,250.00 | \$42,500.00 |
| 2 | INSULATION-CURBSIDE | THERMO KING CORP | 33-2407 | 2540-025-0013 | 2 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 3 | MOTOR-CONDENSER, A/C 27V | THERMO KING CORP | 104-652 | 2540-050-0012 | 68 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 4 | MOTOR-CONDENSER FAN | THERMO KING CORP GILLIG | 78-1460 82-65470-019 | 2540-050-0016 | 59 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 5 | MODULE - MAIN INTELLIGIAIRE | THERMO KING CORP | 419353 | 2540-057-0008 | 27 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 6 | MOULE - DISPLAY INTELLIGIAIRE III (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 45-2339 | 2540-057-0010 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 7 | DRIVERS MODULE-A/C EVAP MOTORS | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3590 | 2540-057-1003 | 7 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 8 | DEHYDRATOR-AIR/COND | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK SPORLAN VALVE | 306-221 25-631-990 C-41E3 | 2540-064-0005 | 47 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 9 | MOTOR ASSEMBLY , EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING ORION | 104-741 G134598FY | 2540-108-0016 | 6 | EACH | \$1,280.00 | \$7,680.00 | \$1,280.00 | \$7,680.00 | \$15,360.00 |
| 10 | MOTOR, CONDENSOR (BRUSHLESS) ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 104-740 G1340598FM | 2540-114-0015 | 41 | EACH | \$1,245.00 | \$51,045.00 | \$1,245.00 | \$51,045.00 | \$102,090.00 |
| 11 | COMPRESSOR - A/C X640 T/K (NOVA) NEW | THERMO KING CORP | 102-657 | 2540-124-0007 | 23 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 12 | BLOWER-A/C EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING CORP | 78-1461 | 2540-141-0015 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 13 | PULLEY-A/C COMPRESSOR,8"DIA., | THERMO KING CORP ORION | 77-1414 H1310513AE | 2540-151-0003 | 12 | EACH | \$1,112.00 | \$13,344.00 | \$1,112.00 | \$13,344.00 | \$26,688.00 |
| 14 | PULLEY-A/C COMP TK, 8"DIA 2 GROOVE | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 77-1672 97-5453-168 | 2540-151-0004 | 9 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 15 | PULLEY, 2.5 B-GROOVE (ORION) | THERMO KING ORION MOHAWK | 77-1752 G1340598EY 16G-2-357 | 2540-151-0046 | 43 | EACH | \$460.00 | \$19,780.00 | \$460.00 | \$19,780.00 | \$39,560.00 |
| 16 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 107-431 97-6505-266 | 2540-189-0003 | 64 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 17 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR 24V | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES ORION | 6310860 H1330507AB | 2540-189-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$772.00 | \$6,948.00 | \$772.00 | \$6,948.00 | \$13,896.00 |
| 18 | FIELD,CLUTCH(24VDC W/2PIN TOWER CONNECT) | THERMO KING ORION | 107-432 H1310513AD | 2540-205-0016 | 10 | EACH | \$482.00 | \$4,820.00 | \$482.00 | \$4,820.00 | \$9,640.00 |
| 19 | CLUTCH ASSEMBLY - A/C (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 107-415 | 2540-205-0019 | 36 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 20 | VALVE-EPR | THERMO KING ORION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-6136 F1340513AL 6321856 | 2540-265-0014 | 3 | EACH | \$1,190.00 | \$3,570.00 | \$1,190.00 | \$3,570.00 | \$7,140.00 |
| 21 | SWITCH-LOW PRESSURE | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 44-8734 6315542 | 2540-289-0003 | 6 | EACH | \$136.00 | \$816.00 | \$136.00 | \$816.00 | \$1,632.00 |
| 22 | HOSE ASSY DISCHARGE-20, STEEL | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-9686 136732 | 2540-325-0002 | 81 | EACH | \$737.00 | \$59,697.00 | \$737.00 | \$59,697.00 | \$119,394.00 |
| 23 | TRANSDUCER - PRESSURE | THERMO KING CORP | 41-5781 | 2540-345-0002 | 14 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 24 | FILTER, AIR | THERMO KING CORP | 130658 | 2710-006-0064 | 23 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 25 | FOAM - ANTI SLOSH (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 33-4680 | 2710-061-0001 | 154 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 26 | HOSE, A/C - #24 ST-45 22.13" LONG | ORION THERMO KING CORP | 081337423 61-4888 | 4720-036-0161 | 45 | EACH | \$1,015.00 | \$45,675.00 | \$1,015.00 | \$45,675.00 | \$91,350.00 |

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|----------------------------------|---|-----------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 27 | HOSE-DISCHARGE, NOVA | THERMO KING CORP | 61-2972 | 4720-036-0167 | 3 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 28 | VALVE, EXPANSION (R-407c) | THERMO KING CORP | 61-5328 | 4810-003-0009 | 12 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 29 | VALVE-CHECK,HOSE | THERMO KING CORP | 66-1273 | 4810-017-0010 | 557 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 30 | VALVE-SOLENOID, A/C HOT WATER | THERMO KING CORP NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-7599 6329442 | 4820-026-0002 | 22 | EACH | \$180.00 | \$3,960.00 | \$180.00 | \$3,960.00 | \$7,920.00 |
| 31 | SCREW, BODY (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 51-2096 | 5305-027-0065 | 38 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 32 | SEAL ASSY-COMP. CRANKSHAFT | THERMO KING CORP | 22-778 | 5330-015-0008 | 16 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 33 | SEAL-CRANKSHAFT A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 22-1100 | 5330-015-0053 | 19 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 34 | SWITCH-HIGH PRESSURE CUT OUT, | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES MOHAWK | 44-7814 6310985 97-2751-152 | 5930-006-0003 | 20 | EACH | \$119.00 | \$2,380.00 | \$119.00 | \$2,380.00 | \$4,760.00 |
| 35 | SWITCH- A/C HIGH PRESSURE (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 41-4486 | 5930-006-0005 | 17 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 36 | RELAY-24V,40/30 AMP | THERMO KING MOHAWK NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-896 87-248-2 6321783 | 5945-021-0013 | 214 | EACH | \$13.55 | \$2,899.70 | \$13.55 | \$2,899.70 | \$5,799.40 |
| 37 | BRUSH-SET EVAP. & COND.MTR. | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 44-4435 G1014330 | 5977-011-0001 | 233 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 38 | HARNESS, COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING ORION | 41-4810 G1340589GR | 6220-007-0311 | 30 | EACH | \$180.00 | \$5,400.00 | \$180.00 | \$5,400.00 | \$10,800.00 |
| 39 | SENSOR-HIGH TEMP. | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-5394 6324707 | 6620-006-0014 | 15 | EACH | \$82.65 | \$1,239.75 | \$82.65 | \$1,239.75 | \$2,479.50 |
| 40 | SENSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3345 | 6620-033-0007 | 25 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 41 | OIL-A/C COMPRESSOR, SYNTHETIC | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 67-404 97-5666-452 | 9150-008-0006 | 57 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |
| 42 | OIL, 407C - A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 2030513 | 9150-027-0001 | 147 | EACH | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID | \$0.00 | NO BID |

THERMO KING OF SAN ANTONIO

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|--|--|------------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 1 | CLUTCH-FIELD, A/C, 24V, TK, ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 45-1965 G1340598EX | 2540-004-0002 | 50 | EACH | \$402.65 | \$20,132.50 | \$416.75 | \$20,837.50 | \$40,970.00 |
| 2 | INSULATION-CURBSIDE | THERMO KING CORP | 33-2407 | 2540-025-0013 | 2 | EACH | \$256.90 | \$513.80 | \$265.90 | \$531.80 | \$1,045.60 |
| 3 | MOTOR-CONDENSER, A/C 27V | THERMO KING CORP | 104-652 | 2540-050-0012 | 68 | EACH | \$2,582.01 | \$175,576.68 | \$2,672.38 | \$181,721.84 | \$357,298.52 |
| 4 | MOTOR-CONDENSER FAN | THERMO KING CORP GILLIG | 78-1460 82-65470-019 | 2540-050-0016 | 59 | EACH | \$720.29 | \$42,497.11 | \$745.50 | \$43,984.50 | \$86,481.61 |
| 5 | MODULE - MAIN INTELLIGIAIRE | THERMO KING CORP | 419353 | 2540-057-0008 | 27 | EACH | \$455.26 | \$12,292.02 | \$471.19 | \$12,722.13 | \$25,014.15 |
| 6 | MOULE - DISPLAY INTELLIGIAIRE III (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 45-2339 | 2540-057-0010 | 12 | EACH | \$300.83 | \$3,609.96 | \$311.35 | \$3,736.20 | \$7,346.16 |
| 7 | DRIVERS MODULE-A/C EVAP MOTORS | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3590 | 2540-057-1003 | 7 | EACH | \$2,904.45 | \$20,331.15 | \$3,006.10 | \$21,042.70 | \$41,373.85 |
| 8 | DEHYDRATOR-AIR/COND | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 306-221 25-631-990 | 2540-064-0005 | 47 | EACH | \$80.86 | \$3,800.42 | \$83.69 | \$3,933.43 | \$7,733.85 |
| 9 | MOTOR ASSEMBLY, EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING ORION | 104-741 G134598FY | 2540-108-0016 | 6 | EACH | \$1,209.34 | \$7,256.04 | \$1,251.66 | \$7,509.96 | \$14,766.00 |
| 10 | MOTOR, CONDENSOR (BRUSHLESS) ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 104-740 G1340598FM | 2540-114-0015 | 41 | EACH | \$1,178.16 | \$48,304.56 | \$1,219.40 | \$49,995.40 | \$98,299.96 |
| 11 | COMPRESSOR - A/C X640 T/K (NOVA) NEW | THERMO KING CORP | 102-657 | 2540-124-0007 | 23 | EACH | \$9,542.88 | \$219,486.24 | \$9,876.88 | \$227,168.24 | \$446,654.48 |
| 12 | BLOWER-A/C EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING CORP | 78-1461 | 2540-141-0015 | 12 | EACH | \$490.33 | \$5,883.96 | \$507.49 | \$6,089.88 | \$11,973.84 |
| 13 | PULLEY-A/C COMPRESSOR, 8"DIA., | THERMO KING CORP ORION | 77-1414 H1310513AE | 2540-151-0003 | 12 | EACH | \$1,045.86 | \$12,550.32 | \$1,082.47 | \$12,989.64 | \$25,539.96 |
| 14 | PULLEY-A/C COMP TK, 8"DIA 2 GROOVE | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 77-1672 97-5453-168 | 2540-151-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$432.62 | \$3,893.58 | \$447.76 | \$4,029.84 | \$7,923.42 |
| 15 | PULLEY, 2.5 B-GROOVE (ORION) | THERMO KING ORION MOHAWK | 77-1752 G1340598EY 16G-2-357 | 2540-151-0046 | 43 | EACH | \$342.91 | \$14,745.13 | \$354.91 | \$15,261.13 | \$30,006.26 |
| 16 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 107-431 97-6505-266 | 2540-189-0003 | 64 | EACH | \$587.96 | \$37,629.44 | \$608.54 | \$38,946.56 | \$76,576.00 |
| 17 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR 24V | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES ORION | 6310860 H1330507AB | 2540-189-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$727.51 | \$6,547.59 | \$752.98 | \$6,776.82 | \$13,324.41 |
| 18 | FIELD,CLUTCH(24VDC W/2PIN TOWER CONNECT) | THERMO KING ORION | H1310513AD 45-2031 | 2540-205-0016 | 10 | EACH | \$454.93 | \$4,549.30 | \$470.86 | \$4,708.60 | \$9,257.90 |
| 19 | CLUTCH ASSEMBLY - A/C (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 107-415 | 2540-205-0019 | 36 | EACH | \$1,470.41 | \$52,934.76 | \$1,521.87 | \$54,787.32 | \$107,722.08 |
| 20 | VALVE-EPR | THERMO KING ORION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-5136 F1340513AL 6321856 | 2540-265-0014 | 3 | EACH | \$1,129.52 | \$3,388.56 | \$1,169.05 | \$3,507.15 | \$6,895.71 |
| 21 | SWITCH-LOW PRESSURE | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 44-8734 6315542 | 2540-289-0003 | 6 | EACH | \$210.64 | \$1,263.84 | \$218.01 | \$1,308.06 | \$2,571.90 |
| 22 | HOSE ASSY DISCHARGE-20, STEEL | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-9686 136732 | 2540-325-0002 | 81 | EACH | \$695.50 | \$56,335.50 | \$719.84 | \$58,307.04 | \$114,642.54 |
| 23 | TRANSDUCER - PRESSURE | THERMO KING CORP | 41-5781 | 2540-345-0002 | 14 | EACH | \$210.64 | \$2,948.96 | \$218.01 | \$3,052.14 | \$6,001.10 |
| 24 | FILTER, AIR | THERMO KING CORP | 130658 | 2710-006-0064 | 23 | EACH | \$9.77 | \$224.71 | \$10.11 | \$232.53 | \$457.24 |
| 25 | FOAM - ANTI SLOSH (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP ORION | 33-4680 081337423 | 2710-061-0001 | 154 | EACH | \$11.25 | \$1,732.50 | \$11.64 | \$1,792.56 | \$3,525.06 |
| 26 | HOSE, A/C - #24 ST-45 22.13" LONG | THERMO KING CORP | 61-4888 | 4720-036-0161 | 45 | EACH | \$957.12 | \$43,070.40 | \$990.62 | \$44,577.90 | \$87,648.30 |

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|----------------------------------|---|-----------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 27 | HOSE-DISCHARGE, NOVA | THERMO KING CORP | 61-2972 | 4720-036-0167 | 3 | EACH | \$607.20 | \$1,821.60 | \$628.46 | \$1,885.38 | \$3,706.98 |
| 28 | VALVE, EXPANSION (R-407c) | THERMO KING CORP | 61-5328 | 4810-003-0009 | 12 | EACH | \$252.30 | \$3,027.60 | \$261.14 | \$3,133.68 | \$6,161.28 |
| 29 | VALVE-CHECK,HOSE | THERMO KING CORP | 66-1273 | 4810-017-0010 | 557 | EACH | \$16.24 | \$9,045.68 | \$16.81 | \$9,363.17 | \$18,408.85 |
| 30 | VALVE-SOLENOID, A/C HOT WATER | THERMO KING CORP NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-7599 6329442 | 4820-026-0002 | 22 | EACH | \$302.28 | \$6,650.16 | \$312.86 | \$6,882.92 | \$13,533.08 |
| 31 | SCREW, BODY (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 51-2096 | 5305-027-0065 | 38 | EACH | \$21.70 | \$824.60 | \$22.46 | \$853.48 | \$1,678.08 |
| 32 | SEAL ASSY-COMP CRANKSHAFT | THERMO KING CORP | 22-778 | 5330-015-0008 | 16 | EACH | \$44.75 | \$716.00 | \$46.32 | \$741.12 | \$1,457.12 |
| 33 | SEAL-CRANKSHAFT A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 22-1100 | 5330-015-0053 | 19 | EACH | \$344.66 | \$6,548.54 | \$356.73 | \$6,777.87 | \$13,326.41 |
| 34 | SWITCH-HIGH PRESSURE CUT OUT, | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES MOHAWK | 44-7814 6310985 97-2751-152 | 5930-006-0003 | 20 | EACH | \$112.12 | \$2,242.40 | \$116.04 | \$2,320.80 | \$4,563.20 |
| 35 | SWITCH- A/C HIGH PRESSURE (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 41-4486 | 5930-006-0005 | 17 | EACH | \$152.37 | \$2,590.29 | \$157.70 | \$2,680.90 | \$5,271.19 |
| 36 | RELAY-24V,40/30 AMP | THERMO KING MOHAWK NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-896 87-248-2 6321783 | 5945-021-0013 | 214 | EACH | \$12.77 | \$2,732.78 | \$13.21 | \$2,826.94 | \$5,559.72 |
| 37 | BRUSH-SET EVAP.& COND.MTR. | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 44-4435 G1014330 | 5977-011-0001 | 233 | EACH | \$85.25 | \$19,863.25 | \$88.23 | \$20,557.59 | \$40,420.84 |
| 38 | HARNESS, COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING ORION | 41-4810 G1340589GR | 6220-007-0311 | 30 | EACH | \$170.06 | \$5,101.80 | \$176.01 | \$5,280.30 | \$10,382.10 |
| 39 | SENSOR-HIGH TEMP. | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-5394 6324707 | 6620-006-0014 | 15 | EACH | \$78.08 | \$1,171.20 | \$80.81 | \$1,212.15 | \$2,383.35 |
| 40 | SENSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3345 | 6620-033-0007 | 25 | EACH | \$226.95 | \$5,673.75 | \$234.89 | \$5,872.25 | \$11,546.00 |
| 41 | OIL-A/C COMPRESSOR, SYNTHETIC | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 67-404 97-5666-452 | 9150-008-0006 | 57 | EACH | \$59.78 | \$3,407.46 | \$61.87 | \$3,526.59 | \$6,934.05 |
| 42 | OIL, 407C - A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 2030513 | 9150-027-0001 | 147 | EACH | \$33.17 | \$4,875.99 | \$34.33 | \$5,046.51 | \$9,922.50 |

THERMO KING OF HOUSTON

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|--|---------------------------------------|------------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 1 | CLUTCH-FIELD, A/C, 24V, TK, ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 45-1965 G1340598EX | 2540-004-0002 | 50 | EACH | \$288.76 | \$14,438.00 | \$298.86 | \$14,943.00 | \$29,381.00 |
| 2 | INSULATION-CURBSIDE | THERMO KING CORP | 33-2407 | 2540-025-0013 | 2 | EACH | \$209.81 | \$419.62 | \$217.15 | \$434.30 | \$853.92 |
| 3 | MOTOR-CONDENSER, A/C 27V | THERMO KING CORP | 104-652 | 2540-050-0012 | 68 | EACH | \$1,702.43 | \$115,765.24 | \$1,762.01 | \$119,816.68 | \$235,581.92 |
| 4 | MOTOR-CONDENSER FAN | THERMO KING CORP GILLIG | 78-1460 82-65470-019 | 2540-050-0016 | 59 | EACH | \$455.93 | \$26,899.87 | \$471.88 | \$27,840.92 | \$54,740.79 |
| 5 | MODULE - MAIN INTELLIGIAIRE | THERMO KING CORP | 419353 | 2540-057-0008 | 27 | EACH | \$319.39 | \$8,623.53 | \$330.56 | \$8,925.12 | \$17,548.65 |
| 6 | MOULE - DISPLAY INTELLIGIAIRE III (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 45-2339 | 2540-057-0010 | 12 | EACH | \$211.04 | \$2,532.48 | \$218.43 | \$2,621.16 | \$5,153.64 |
| 7 | DRIVERS MODULE-A/C EVAP MOTORS | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3590 | 2540-057-1003 | 7 | EACH | \$1,915.03 | \$13,405.21 | \$1,982.05 | \$13,874.35 | \$27,279.56 |
| 8 | DEHYDRATOR-AIR/COND | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK SPORLAN VALVE | 306-221 25-631-990 C-41E3 | 2540-064-0005 | 47 | EACH | \$56.72 | \$2,665.84 | \$58.71 | \$2,759.37 | \$5,425.21 |
| 9 | MOTOR ASSEMBLY , EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING ORION | 104-741 G134598FY | 2540-108-0016 | 6 | EACH | \$765.47 | \$4,592.82 | \$792.26 | \$4,753.56 | \$9,346.38 |
| 10 | MOTOR, CONDENSOR (BRUSHLESS) ORION | THERMO KING ORION | 104-740 G1340598FM | 2540-114-0015 | 41 | EACH | \$745.74 | \$30,575.34 | \$771.84 | \$31,645.44 | \$62,220.78 |
| 11 | COMPRESSOR - A/C X640 T/K (NOVA) N | THERMO KING CORP | 102-657 | 2540-124-0007 | 23 | EACH | \$6,292.01 | \$144,716.23 | \$6,512.24 | \$149,781.52 | \$294,497.75 |
| 12 | BLOWER-A/C EVAPORATOR | THERMO KING CORP | 78-1461 77-1414 | 2540-141-0015 | 12 | EACH | \$351.63 | \$4,219.56 | \$363.93 | \$4,367.16 | \$8,586.72 |
| 13 | PULLEY-A/C COMPRESSOR,8"DIA , | THERMO KING ORION | H1310513AE | 2540-151-0003 | 12 | EACH | \$661.99 | \$7,943.88 | \$685.16 | \$8,221.92 | \$16,165.80 |
| 14 | PULLEY-A/C COMP TK, 8"DIA 2 GROOV | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 77-1672 97-5453-168 | 2540-151-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$264.96 | \$2,384.64 | \$274.23 | \$2,468.07 | \$4,852.71 |
| 15 | PULLEY, 2.5 B-GROOVE (ORION) | THERMO KING ORION MOHAWK | 77-1752 G1340598EY 16G-2-357 | 2540-151-0046 | 43 | EACH | \$210.01 | \$9,030.43 | \$217.36 | \$9,346.48 | \$18,376.91 |
| 16 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 107-431 97-6505-266 | 2540-189-0003 | 64 | EACH | \$360.10 | \$23,046.40 | \$372.70 | \$23,852.80 | \$46,899.20 |
| 17 | KIT-CLUTCH DRIVE REPAIR 24V | NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES ORION | 6310860 H1330507AB 107-432 | 2540-189-0004 | 9 | EACH | \$460.49 | \$4,144.41 | \$476.60 | \$4,289.40 | \$8,433.81 |
| 18 | FIELD,CLUTCH(24VDC W/2PIN TOWER | THERMO KING ORION | H1310513AD | 2540-205-0016 | 10 | EACH | \$287.96 | \$2,879.60 | \$298.04 | \$2,980.40 | \$5,860.00 |
| 19 | CLUTCH ASSEMBLY - A/C (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 107-415 | 2540-205-0019 | 36 | EACH | \$969.50 | \$34,902.00 | \$1,003.44 | \$36,123.84 | \$71,025.84 |
| 20 | VALVE-EPR | THERMO KING ORION | 66-5136 F1340513AL | 2540-265-0014 | 3 | EACH | \$685.16 | \$2,055.48 | \$709.14 | \$2,127.42 | \$4,182.90 |
| 21 | SWITCH-LOW PRESSURE | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 44-8734 6315542 | 2540-289-0003 | 6 | EACH | \$74.42 | \$446.52 | \$77.02 | \$462.12 | \$908.64 |
| 22 | HOSE ASSY DISCHARGE-20, STEEL | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 66-9686 136732 | 2540-325-0002 | 81 | EACH | \$445.33 | \$36,071.73 | \$460.91 | \$37,333.71 | \$73,405.44 |
| 23 | TRANSDUCER - PRESSURE | THERMO KING CORP | 41-5781 | 2540-345-0002 | 14 | EACH | \$147.78 | \$2,068.92 | \$152.94 | \$2,141.16 | \$4,210.08 |
| 24 | FILTER, AIR | THERMO KING CORP | 130658 | 2710-006-0064 | 23 | EACH | \$7.61 | \$175.03 | \$7.87 | \$181.01 | \$356.04 |
| 25 | FOAM - ANTI SLOSH (NOVA) | THERMO KING ORION | 33-4680 081337423 | 2710-061-0001 | 154 | EACH | \$7.89 | \$1,215.06 | \$8.17 | \$1,258.18 | \$2,473.24 |
| 26 | HOSE, A/C - #24 ST-45 22.13" LONG | THERMO KING CORP | 61-4888 | 4720-036-0161 | 45 | EACH | \$605.83 | \$27,262.35 | \$627.02 | \$28,215.90 | \$55,478.25 |

| Item No | Material Description | Manufacturer | Part Number | METRO PART NUMBER | Estimated Quantity For Each Contract Year | UOM | Contract Period First Year | | Contract Period Second Year | | |
|---------|----------------------------------|---|-----------------------------------|-------------------|---|------|----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|---------------------|-----------------------------|
| | | | | | | | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Unit Bid Price | Extended Bid Amount | Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2 |
| 27 | HOSE-DISCHARGE, NOVA | THERMO KING CORP | 61-2972 | 4720-036-0167 | 3 | EACH | \$384.34 | \$1,153.02 | \$397.79 | \$1,193.37 | \$2,346.39 |
| 28 | VALVE, EXPANSION (R-407c) | THERMO KING CORP | 61-5328 | 4810-003-0009 | 12 | EACH | \$177.00 | \$2,124.00 | \$183.19 | \$2,198.28 | \$4,322.28 |
| 29 | VALVE-CHECK,HOSE | THERMO KING CORP | 66-1273 | 4810-017-0010 | 557 | EACH | \$11.90 | \$6,628.30 | \$12.45 | \$6,934.65 | \$13,562.95 |
| 30 | VALVE-SOLENOID, A/C HOT WATER | THERMO KING CORP NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-7599 6329442 | 4820-026-0002 | 22 | EACH | \$191.33 | \$4,209.26 | \$198.02 | \$4,356.44 | \$8,565.70 |
| 31 | SCREW, BODY (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 51-2096 | 5305-027-0065 | 38 | EACH | \$15.23 | \$578.74 | \$15.76 | \$598.88 | \$1,177.62 |
| 32 | SEAL ASSY-COMP. CRANKSHAFT | THERMO KING CORP | 22-778 | 5330-015-0008 | 16 | EACH | \$37.77 | \$604.32 | \$39.09 | \$625.44 | \$1,229.76 |
| 33 | SEAL-CRANKSHAFT A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 22-1100 | 5330-015-0053 | 19 | EACH | \$255.23 | \$4,849.37 | \$264.16 | \$5,019.04 | \$9,868.41 |
| 34 | SWITCH-HIGH PRESSURE CUT OUT, | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES MOHAWK | 44-7814 6310985 97-2751-152 | 5930-006-0003 | 20 | EACH | \$70.97 | \$1,419.40 | \$73.45 | \$1,469.00 | \$2,888.40 |
| 35 | SWITCH- A/C HIGH PRESSURE (NOVA) | THERMO KING CORP | 41-4486 | 5930-006-0005 | 17 | EACH | \$106.89 | \$1,817.13 | \$110.63 | \$1,880.71 | \$3,697.84 |
| 36 | RELAY-24V,40/30 AMP | THERMO KING MOHAWK NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-896 87-248-2 6321783 | 5945-021-0013 | 214 | EACH | \$9.26 | \$1,981.64 | \$9.58 | \$2,050.12 | \$4,031.76 |
| 37 | BRUSH-SET EVAP.& COND.MTR. | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 44-4435 G1014330 | 5977-011-0001 | 233 | EACH | \$52.21 | \$12,164.93 | \$54.03 | \$12,588.99 | \$24,753.92 |
| 38 | HARNESS, COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING ORION | 41-4810 G1340589GR | 6220-007-0311 | 30 | EACH | \$107.64 | \$3,229.20 | \$111.41 | \$3,342.30 | \$6,571.50 |
| 39 | SENSOR-HIGH TEMP. | THERMO KING NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES | 41-5394 6324707 | 6620-006-0014 | 15 | EACH | \$49.42 | \$741.30 | \$51.16 | \$767.40 | \$1,508.70 |
| 40 | SENSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 41-3345 | 6620-033-0007 | 25 | EACH | \$159.21 | \$3,980.25 | \$164.79 | \$4,119.75 | \$8,100.00 |
| 41 | OIL-A/C COMPRESSOR, SYNTHETIC | THERMO KING CORP MOHAWK | 67-404 97-5666-452 | 9150-008-0006 | 57 | EACH | \$43.91 | \$2,502.87 | \$45.45 | \$2,590.65 | \$5,093.52 |
| 42 | OIL, 407C - A/C COMPRESSOR | THERMO KING CORP | 2030513 | 9150-027-0001 | 147 | EACH | \$26.58 | \$3,907.26 | \$27.52 | \$4,045.44 | \$7,952.70 |