

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF AXLETECH PARTS FOR BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: IB1100005
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 12/16/2010 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: Alexandra Hernandez

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 1	Item 2	Item 4	Item 6	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	Item 15	Item 17	Item 18	Item 22	Item 23	Item 24	Item 25	Item 27	Item 28	REMARKS
	METRO Estimate	\$4,817.82	\$3,744.62	\$524.18	\$1,503.90	\$8,778.88	\$2,514.72	\$54,440.79	\$5,028.07	\$4,034.16	\$7,583.90	\$425.55	\$11,367.35	\$403.98	\$7,484.51	\$426.86	\$249.60	\$1,245.71	
1.	New Flyer Winnipeg, Canada	\$4,351.11	\$3,766.17	\$469.98	\$1,764.98	\$3,817.55	\$2,866.71	\$56,513.31	\$6,956.01	\$4,782.00	\$8,286.55	\$464.94	\$13,339.95	\$466.44	\$8,197.74	\$500.96	\$78.75	\$1,364.40	
2.	Azle Tech Troy, MI	\$4,436.34	\$3,839.34	\$572.04	\$1,798.49	\$3,892.35	\$2,922.87	\$57,620.94	\$6,072.72	\$4,827.00	\$8,326.46	\$494.46	\$13,601.25	\$522.60	\$8,573.90	\$510.80	\$619.50	\$1,535.80	
3	Gillig Hayward, CA	\$4,827.38	\$4,149.39	\$500.22	\$1,943.06	\$3,995.75	\$3,487.54	\$59,380.50	\$5,976.00	\$4,933.20	\$10,230.22	\$814.18	\$13,801.25	\$804.89	\$10,696.28	\$504.20	\$92.25	\$1,642.60	
4.	Muncie TransIt Supply Mucie, IN			\$505.26															
5.																			
6																			
7																			
8																			
9																			
10																			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF AXLETECH PARTS FOR BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: IB1100005

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 12/16/2010 @ 10:00AM

Recorded by: Alejandra Hernandez

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 3	Item 11	Item 13	Item 16	Item 20	Item 21	Item 26	REMARKS
	METRO Estimate	\$80,087.28	\$242.81	\$231.71	\$284.02	\$275.56	\$82.69	\$140.85	
1.	Axle Tech Troy, MI	\$95,828.40	\$246.40	\$277.60	\$315.88	\$333.04	\$75.35	\$153.16	
2.	New Flyer Winnipeg, Canada	\$104,591.98	\$254.40	\$286.80	\$325.95	\$351.44	\$86.31	\$162.68	
3.	Gillig Hayward, CA	\$103,834.24	\$251.20	\$310.00	\$358.81	\$372.60	\$101.38	\$183.24	
4.	Muncie Transit Supply Muncie, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5.									
6.									
7.									
8.									
9.									
10.									

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices and stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF AXLETECH PARTS FOR BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: IB1100005

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 12/16/2010 @ 10:00AM

Recorded by: Alejandra Hernandez

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER				REMARKS
		Item 5	Item 12	Item 14	
	METRO Estimate	\$43,698.45	\$701.34	\$8,308.54	
1.	Gillig Hayward, CA	\$45,885.00	\$761.10	\$4,570.11	
2.	New Flyer Winnipeg, Canada	\$46,126.11	\$768.18	\$4,747.93	
3.	Axle Tech Troy, MI	\$47,029.75	\$764.05	\$7,988.98	
4.	Muncie Transit Supply Muncie, IN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5.					
6.					
7.					
8.					
9.					
10.					

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Shirley M. Galt
Contract Administrator I

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Alan P. Huff
Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
FINAL BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF AXLETECH PARTS FOR BUSES

SOLICITATION NO.: IB1100005
DATE/TIME 12/16/2010 @ 10:00 AM

RECORDED BY: Alejandra Hernandez

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	ITEM 19	REMARKS
	METRO Estimate	\$291.19	
1.	Muncie Transit Supply Muncie, IN	\$352.80	
2.	New Flyer Winnipeg, Canada	\$391.41	
3.	Axletech Troy, MI	\$518.40	
4.	Gillig LLC Hayward, CA	\$402.48	
5.			
6.			
7.			
8.			
9.			
10.			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.


Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.


Manager of Procurement