

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
 BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF FILTERS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4018000140

BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 05/17/2018 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: FATIMA RUBIO

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM													
		Item 1	Item 2	Item 3	Item 4	Item 5	Item 6	Item 7	Item 8	Item 9	Item 10	Item 11	Item 12	Item 13	Item 14
1.	MEGA PARTS LAKESIDE, CA 92040	NO BID	\$3,992.24	NO BID	\$22,748.58	NO BID	\$46,476.92	\$43,668.90	\$8,352.84	\$9,768.00	\$17,024.76	\$41,669.12	\$75,453.18	\$29,709.54	\$19,167.72
2.	NEOPART TRANSIT READING, PA 19608	\$480.70	NO BID	\$7,463.60	\$27,395.94	NO BID	\$27,686.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16,057.98	\$35,410.88	\$60,785.56	\$20,009.85	NO BID
3.	GILLIG, LLC HAYWARD, CA 94545	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.	DARTCO TRANSMISSION CHARLOTTE, NC 28206	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5.	FARM & CITY SUPPLY, LLC INDIANOLA, IA 50125	NO BID	\$2,408.00	NO BID	\$29,398.26	NO BID	\$17,221.20	\$61,425.18	\$6,121.28	\$10,278.40	\$14,973.30	\$38,336.64	\$76,188.86	\$21,976.92	\$17,142.84
6	NEW FLYER PARTS DELAWARE, OH 43015	NO BID	\$5,488.00	\$9,964.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$68,170.00	\$14,758.00	\$16,060.00	\$21,693.60	\$36,736.00	\$86,442.40	\$39,341.40	NO BID
7	MUNCIE MUNCIE, IN 47302	\$534.38	\$3,010.28	\$8,010.68	\$39,310.98	\$7,142.30	\$22,402.80	\$61,377.06	\$8,058.62	\$12,768.80	\$19,818.99	\$50,236.48	\$102,029.62	\$29,370.39	\$20,476.17
8	AUTO PLUS MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057-1042	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18,168.39	NO BID	\$133,204.06	NO BID	NO BID
9	KIRKS AUTOMOTIVE DETROIT, MI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20,608.92	NO BID	\$149,389.02	NO BID	NO BID
10	CBM US CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138	NO BID	NO BID	\$9,061.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$47,109.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BOCA RATON, FL	\$616.00	\$3,518.48	NO BID	\$28,017.03	NO BID	\$24,950.42	\$65,491.32	\$8,640.48	\$14,427.60	\$16,317.36	\$36,867.20	\$62,831.67	\$19,964.63	\$24,573.12
12	NORTHWEST DRIVE TRAIN HOUSTON, TX 77041	\$502.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$29,234.49	NO BID	\$29,118.56	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16,895.07	\$41,236.16	\$116,237.44	NO BID	NO BID

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

\_\_\_\_\_  
 Contract Administrator

  
 Manager of Procurement

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
BID ABSTRACT

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 15	Item 16	Item 17	Item 18	Item 19	Item 20	Item 21	Item 22	Item 23	Item 24	Item 25	Item 26	Item 27
1.	MEGA PARTS LAKESIDE, CA 92040	\$39,467.52	\$6,022.08	\$84,331.98	\$4,818.40	\$9,932.76	\$16,226.00	\$27,421.68	\$14,716.80	\$8,977.56	\$25,887.74	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.	NEOPART TRANSIT READING, PA 19608	\$23,411.00	\$4,287.06	\$59,814.18	\$4,044.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,482.20	\$2,868.40	NO BID
3.	GILLIG, LLC HAYWARD, CA 94545	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.	DARTCO TRANSMISSION CHARLOTTE, NC 28206	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,635.90
5.	FARM & CITY SUPPLY, LLC INDIANOLA, IA 50125	\$24,393.12	\$3,828.06	\$63,931.32	\$3,575.76	\$11,047.22	\$20,514.30	\$35,610.96	\$16,257.60	\$10,513.32	\$28,239.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	NEW FLYER PARTS DELAWARE, OH 43015	NO BID	NO BID	\$61,063.20	\$4,279.50	NO BID	\$32,915.60	\$33,708.40	\$38,520.00	\$25,311.60	\$31,558.00	\$4,334.00	NO BID	\$2,074.80
7	MUNCIE MUNCIE, IN 47302	\$32,592.68	\$5,127.03	\$85,557.87	\$4,786.70	\$13,806.32	\$25,648.67	\$44,544.72	\$19,929.60	\$13,144.02	\$37,085.74	\$3,086.99	\$3,229.08	\$1,819.44
8	AUTO PLUS MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057-1042	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9	KIRKS AUTOMOTIVE DETROIT, MI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
10	CBM US CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BOCA RATON, FL	\$24,301.76	\$4,502.79	\$61,965.27	\$4,285.84	\$15,683.59	\$28,777.97	\$50,914.16	\$22,766.40	\$15,002.10	\$32,672.71	\$2,649.65	\$3,092.76	NO BID
12	NORTHWEST DRIVE TRAIN HOUSTON, TX 77041	\$25,009.80	\$4,456.89	\$64,046.97	\$4,241.46	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,604.34	NO BID	NO BID

I certify that I have personally opened and read a

\_\_\_\_\_  
Contract Administrator

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
BID ABSTRACT

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 28	Item 29	Item 30	Item 31	Item 32	Item 33	Item 34	Item 35	Item 36	Item 37	Item 38	Item 39	Item 40	Item 41
1.	MEGA PARTS LAKESIDE, CA 92040	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,494.44	\$4,947.00	\$52,164.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2.	NEOPART TRANSIT READING, PA 19608	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,827.88	\$3,442.50	NO BID	\$15,169.60	NO BID	NO BID
3.	GILLIG, LLC HAYWARD, CA 94545	\$99,552.00	\$36,819.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$32,282.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.	DARTCO TRANSMISSION CHARLOTTE, NC 28206	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5.	FARM & CITY SUPPLY, LLC INDIANOLA, IA 50125	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,746.04	\$3,400.00	\$27,783.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.	NEW FLYER PARTS DELAWARE, OH 43015	\$104,676.00	\$35,200.00	NO BID	\$39,163.20	NO BID	NO BID	\$25,785.00	\$12,467.00	NO BID	\$4,760.00	\$44,730.00	\$27,445.00	NO BID	\$24,711.20
7.	MUNCIE MUNCIE, IN 47302	NO BID	\$24,654.08	\$10,812.51	\$38,223.48	\$27,590.09	\$974.28	NO BID	\$12,486.18	\$5,008.98	\$4,547.50	\$33,720.75	\$18,742.44	NO BID	NO BID
8.	AUTO PLUS MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057-1042	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,020.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
9.	KIRKS AUTOMOTIVE DETROIT, MI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,632.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
10.	CBM US CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11.	VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BOCA RATON, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,110.60	\$3,587.00	\$38,046.75	\$15,598.74	\$20,899.74	NO BID
12.	NORTHWEST DRIVE TRAIN HOUSTON, TX 77041	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,129.20	\$3,697.50	NO BID	\$16,182.57	NO BID	NO BID

I certify that I have personally opened and read a

\_\_\_\_\_  
Contract Administrator

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY  
BID ABSTRACT

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	Item 42	Item 43	Item 44	Item 45	Item 46	Item 47	Item 48	Item 49	REMARKS
1.	MEGA PARTS LAKESIDE, CA 92040	NO BID	\$3,989.40	\$19,024.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$64,898.98	
2.	NEOPART TRANSIT READING, PA 19608	NO BID	\$7,004.34	\$18,537.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
3.	GILLIG, LLC HAYWARD, CA 94545	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
4.	DARTCO TRANSMISSION CHARLOTTE, NC 28206	\$5,354.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$27,749.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5.	FARM & CITY SUPPLY, LLC INDIANOLA, IA 50125	NO BID	\$5,794.44	\$14,802.88	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$78,082.74	
6	NEW FLYER PARTS DELAWARE, OH 43015	\$4,920.00	NO BID	\$23,780.80	\$37,403.52	NO BID	\$9,900.00	NO BID	\$94,592.00	
7	MUNCIE MUNCIE, IN 47302	\$6,018.00	\$7,753.17	\$18,510.28	\$28,367.28	\$5,288.85	\$11,596.25	\$16,128.00	\$98,353.51	
8	AUTO PLUS MOORESTOWN, NJ 08057-1042	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
9	KIRKS AUTOMOTIVE DETROIT, MI	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
10	CBM US CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
11	VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BOCA RATON, FL	NO BID	\$8,789.76	\$20,841.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$97,924.89	
12	NORTHWEST DRIVE TRAIN HOUSTON, TX 77041	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

I certify that I have personally opened and read a

\_\_\_\_\_ Contract Administrator