

COMPANY NAME: PREVOST CAR INC.

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	\$943.00	\$7,544.00	\$966.58	\$7,732.64	\$15,276.64
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	\$228.80	\$915.20	\$234.52	\$938.08	\$1,853.28
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	\$1,005.00	\$3,015.00	\$1,030.13	\$3,090.39	\$6,105.39
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	\$184.40	\$2,581.60	\$189.01	\$2,646.14	\$5,227.74
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	081501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	\$789.00	\$1,578.00	\$808.73	\$1,617.46	\$3,195.46
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	\$203.37	\$1,220.22	\$208.45	\$1,250.70	\$2,470.92
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	\$203.37	\$3,050.55	\$208.45	\$3,126.75	\$6,177.30
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	\$212.60	\$4,464.60	\$217.92	\$4,576.32	\$9,040.92
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	\$1,060.00	\$11,660.00	\$1,086.50	\$11,951.50	\$23,611.50
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	NOVA SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	\$400.00	\$2,800.00	\$410.00	\$2,870.00	\$5,670.00
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID

COMPANY NAME: MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	081501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	\$1,340.00	\$14,740.00	\$1,359.00	\$14,949.00	\$29,689.00
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	NOVA SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID

COMPANY NAME: MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	\$904.40	\$7,235.20	\$931.53	\$7,452.24	\$14,687.44
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	\$235.50	\$942.00	\$242.57	\$970.28	\$1,912.28
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	\$978.87	\$2,936.61	\$1,008.24	\$3,024.72	\$5,961.33
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	\$176.80	\$2,475.20	\$182.10	\$2,549.40	\$5,024.60
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	081501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	\$820.72	\$1,641.44	\$845.34	\$1,690.68	\$3,332.12
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	\$194.12	\$1,164.72	\$199.94	\$1,199.64	\$2,364.36
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	\$194.12	\$2,911.80	\$199.94	\$2,999.10	\$5,910.90
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	\$204.93	\$4,303.53	\$211.08	\$4,432.68	\$8,736.21
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	\$1,032.49	\$11,357.39	\$1,063.46	\$11,698.06	\$23,055.45
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	NOVA SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	\$365.85	\$2,560.95	\$376.83	\$2,637.81	\$5,198.76
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID

COMPANY NAME: JANEK CORP.

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	\$150.00	\$2,100.00	\$150.00	\$2,100.00	\$4,200.00
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	U81501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	\$150.00	\$900.00	\$150.00	\$900.00	\$1,800.00
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	\$150.00	\$2,250.00	\$150.00	\$2,250.00	\$4,500.00
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	NOVA SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID

COMPANY NAME: THE AFTERMARKET PARTS

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	\$957.51	\$7,660.08	\$957.51	\$7,660.08	\$15,320.16
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	\$248.68	\$994.72	\$248.68	\$994.72	\$1,989.44
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	\$1,051.54	\$3,154.62	\$1,051.54	\$3,154.62	\$6,309.24
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	\$183.02	\$2,562.28	\$183.02	\$2,562.28	\$5,124.56
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	\$877.70	\$877.70	\$877.70	\$877.70	\$1,755.40
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	081501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	\$818.50	\$1,637.00	\$818.50	\$1,637.00	\$3,274.00
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	\$205.99	\$1,235.94	\$205.99	\$1,235.94	\$2,471.88
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	\$205.99	\$3,089.85	\$205.99	\$3,089.85	\$6,179.70
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	\$215.35	\$4,522.35	\$215.35	\$4,522.35	\$9,044.70
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	\$1,127.36	\$12,400.96	\$1,127.36	\$12,400.96	\$24,801.92
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	NOVA SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	\$380.89	\$2,666.23	\$380.89	\$2,666.23	\$5,332.46
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	\$1,011.10	\$12,133.20	\$1,011.10	\$12,133.20	\$24,266.40

COMPANY NAME: AJL PROJECT SERVICES INC.

Item No	Material Description	APPROVED MANUFACTURER	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER	METRO PART NUMBER	Estimated Quantity for Each Contract Year	UOM	Contract Period First Year		Contract Period Second Year		Total Bid Price Years 1 & 2
							Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	Unit Bid Price	Extended Bid Amount	
1	BUMPER ASSEMBLY-REAR	ROMEO RIM	A01180003AXA	2510-073-0139	8	Each	\$1,167.00	\$9,336.00	\$1,175.00	\$9,400.00	\$18,736.00
2	MODULE LH	ROMEO RIM	S70000001AXA	2510-073-0161	4	Each	\$304.00	\$1,216.00	\$310.00	\$1,240.00	\$2,456.00
3	BUMPER ASM-REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	A00750003AXA	2510-073-0163	3	Each	\$1,242.00	\$3,726.00	\$1,247.00	\$3,741.00	\$7,467.00
4	MODULE-END LH REAR BUMPER	ROMEO RIM	S00750002AXA	2510-073-0165	14	Each	\$230.00	\$3,220.00	\$235.00	\$3,290.00	\$6,510.00
5	BUMPER ASM-FRONT	ROMEO RIM	A61080001AXA	2510-073-0170	8	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
6	BUMPER ASSY-FRONT, HYBRID	ROMEO RIM	A20160103AXA	2510-073-0187	1	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
7	BUMPER, REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	081501505 A02140101AXA	2510-073-0195	2	Each	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,005.00	\$2,010.00	\$4,010.00
8	BUMPER MODULE, R/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00771701AXA	2510-073-0196	6	Each	\$238.00	\$1,428.00	\$242.00	\$1,452.00	\$2,880.00
9	BUMPER MODULE, C/S REAR (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501505AB S00781701AXA	2510-073-0198	15	Each	\$252.00	\$3,780.00	\$258.00	\$3,870.00	\$7,650.00
10	BUMPER MODULE, FRT C/S (ORION)	ORION BUS INDUSTRIES, INC. ROMEO RIM	H1501507AD S20050201AXA	2510-073-0201	21	Each	\$264.00	\$5,544.00	\$272.00	\$5,712.00	\$11,256.00
11	BUMPER, FRONT (NOVA)	ROMEO RIM NOVA	A50400101AXA	2510-073-0210	11	Each	\$1,332.00	\$14,652.00	\$1,340.00	\$14,740.00	\$29,392.00
12	BUMPER, HALF - RH REAR (NOVA)	SPECIALITY MFG. GROUP	N8900358 550010R3	2510-073-0212	7	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID
13	BUMPER, FRONT, GEN3, TSB, BLACK (NABI)	ROMEO RIM	A20190101AXA	2510-073-0217	12	Each	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID	\$0.00	NO BID