

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
BID ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF MERITOR PARTS

SOLICITATION NO.: 4017000246


BID OPENING DATE/TIME: 09/28/2017 @ 10:00AM

RECORDED BY: ASHANTI BROWN

NO	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDER	TOTAL BID AMOUNT BY ITEM					REMARKS
1	AXLETECH TROY, MI 48083	\$1,820.28	\$2,397.20	\$36,290.76	\$34,505.52	\$2,563.12	
2	SOUTHERN COACH PARTS BIRMINGHAM, AL 35236	\$4,125.18	\$2,988.60	NO BID	\$76,621.28	\$6,517.28	
3	THE AFTERMARKET PARTS CO., LLC DELAWARE, OH	\$4,846.20	\$6,800.00	\$62,040.00	\$116,748.00	\$5,290.00	
4	GILLIG, LLC HAYWARD, CA	\$3,947.88	\$2,979.70	NO BID	\$79,885.90	\$5,399.48	
5	MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY MUNCIE, IN	\$4,077.90	\$3,054.20	NO BID	\$83,777.50	\$6,039.80	
6	NEOPART TRANSIT, LLC. READING, PA 19608	\$3,782.40	\$2,856.00	NO BID	\$75,583.52	\$4,929.36	
7	VEHICLE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BOCA RATON, FL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
8	MOTOR COACH INDUSTRIES LOUISVILL, KY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
9	PREVOST CAR, INC. ELGIN, IL	\$4,083.81	\$4,524.80	NO BID	\$87,344.80	\$5,547.14	
10	CBM US INC. CAMBRIDGE, MA 02138	\$5,295.36	\$3,173.10	NO BID	\$85,031.46	NO BID	
11	MOHAWK MFG AND SUPPLY CO. NILES, ILLINOIS 60714	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
12	MIDWEST BUS CORP OWOSCO, MI 48867	\$4,030.62	\$3,044.80	NO BID	\$81,615.50	\$5,911.92	
13	TILES IN STYLE WILLOWBROOK, IL 60527	\$12,499.65	\$7,681.70	\$82,566.00	\$539,127.13	\$10,120.46	

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.



Contract Administrator



Manager of Procurement