

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF BUS FUILDS

IFB NO. : 4020000122

BID OPENING: 6/19/2020 TIME: 2:00PM

RECORDED BY: PRINSCRELLA ABBS

NO.	NAME AND CITY OF PROPOSER	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 1 ANTIFREEZE /COOLANT	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 2 AUTOMATIC-TRANSMISSION FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 3 1 YEAR ESTIMATE DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 4 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 CK-4	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 5 GEAR OIL	TOTAL AMOUNT GROUP 6 ENGINE OIL SAE 15W-40 API CF-4 CES20092	REMARKS
1	LEVEL3 CORPORATION HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	\$242,045.83	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
2	JAMISON PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AURORA, CO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$107,855.64	
3	ATLANTIC PETROLEUM HOUSTON, TX	\$219,730.71	\$1,141,436.14	\$367,886.55	\$1,134,737.10	\$320,617.08	\$216,654.36	
4	MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY GAINESVILLE, GA	NO BID	NO BID	\$242,300.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
5	THREE L INC, HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	\$803,108.28	\$242,623.50	\$1,026,666.90	\$258,410.70	\$183,744.00	
6	BLENDER DIRECT HOUSTON, TX	NO BID	NO BID	\$488,275.80	\$764,210.70	\$166,175.55	NO BID	
7	AJ HUNT Jr INC. HOUSTON, TX	\$539,366.09	\$1,095,361.67	\$237,308.89	\$872,280.90	\$222,878.70	\$362,320.20	
8	SUNDANCE FUELS SPRING, TX	NO BID	\$983,706.75	NO BID	\$963,368.64	\$241,490.70	\$204,415.20	
9	SUN COAST HOUSTON, TX	\$1,283,249.92	\$1,038,188.97	\$251,866.30	\$1,905,123.24	\$405,974.25	\$236,187.60	
10	APACHE OIL COMPANY PASADENA, TX	NO BID	\$899,965.56	NO BID	\$748,772.10	\$157,038.75	\$140,679.00	
11	TRANSLIQUID TECHNOLOGIES SPRING, TX	NO BID	NO BID	\$231,070.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Group 3-Diesel Exhaust Fluid will not be awarded. A new solicitation was issued.

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Fatima Rubio

Raul Arenas

Contract Administrator

Manager of Procurement