

2540-285-0008 VALVE ASSEMBLY-MAIN HE	2 EA	Val.: 24 Price: Rank:	1,499.04 719.52 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2540-320-0011 VALVE ASSEMBLY	17 EA	Val.: 25 Price: Rank:	2,253.01 132.53 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2546-045-1002 WIPER MOTOR ASSY, LH	12 EA	Val.: 26 Price: Rank:	4,488.48 374.04 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2546-056-0001 DRIVE UNIT-W/S WIPER,	3 EA	Val.: 27 Price: Rank:	984.15 328.05 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2560-019-0002 REGULATOR, VOLTAGE-INT	7 EA	Val.: 29 Price: Rank:	366.1 52.3 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	489.3 69.9 3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	341.88 48.84 1	Non-responsive
2710-001-0065 FILTER-AIR INTAKE, PAR	3,202 EA	Val.: 30 Price: Rank:	4,899.06 1.53 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5,411.38 1.69 2	
2815-529-0001 BELT - DRIVE, GENERATO	168 EA	Val.: 34 Price: Rank:	14,664.72 87.29 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2930-031-1015 CLUTCH - FAN	3 EA	Val.: 36 Price: Rank:	1,951.50 650.5 2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1,589.85 529.95 1	Non-responsive
3030-013-0001 BELT - FAN	13 EA	Val.: 42 Price: Rank:	2,885.74 221.98 1	5,207.15 400.55 6	4,147.00 319 5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3,144.83 241.91 3	4,093.70 314.9 4	3,133.00 241 2		
6250-014-0001 BALLAST - SMART	23 EA	Val.: 51 Price: Rank:	1,164.95 50.65 1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<p>I certify that I have personally obtained and read all bids received by the time set for receipts.</p> <p><i>[Signature]</i> Contract Administrator</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p><i>[Signature]</i> Manager of Procurement</p>													

Material Sh. Text Qty. In Base Unit	ITEM NO.	Quot.:	Muncie IB1100062	Bearings & Industrial IB1100062	Neopart IB1100062	Daimler IB1100062	Nabl IB1100062	Prevost IB1100062	Gillig IB1100062	New Flyer IB1100062	MCI IB1100062
2510-076-0020 LINK-SWAY BAR 44 EA	5	Val.: 2,705.11 Price: 61.48 Rank: 1	2,710.40 61.6 2	no price	2,834.48 64.42 2	no bid no price	no bid no price	3,022.80 68.73 4	3,024.12 68.73 5	no price	no price
2510-481-0001 BUSHING-RETAINING, SWA 105 EA	13	Val.: 1,457.40 Price: 13.88 Rank: 1	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	7,828.80 74.56 3	1,503.60 14.32 2
2530-105-0006 END-TIE ROD, L.H. 6 EA	20	Val.: 119.34 Price: 19.89 Rank: 1	190.2 31.7 5	no price	no price	no price	no price	161.4 26.9 3	604.38 100.73 6	189.84 31.64 4	154.02 25.67 2
3030-003-2470 BELT-FAN, CAC TO RADIA 42 EA	41	Val.: 840.84 Price: 20.02 Rank: 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	1,166.34 27.77 2
5977-003-0017 BRUSH-MOTOR, A/C BLOWE 626 EA	48	Val.: 2,935.94 Price: 4.69 Rank: 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	4,688.74 7.49 3	no price	no price	3,756.00 6 2
5977-003-0018 BRUSH-A/C CONDENSER MO 985 EA	49	Val.: 3,437.65 Price: 3.49 Rank: 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	20,616.05 20,993 3	no price	5,988.80 6.08 2
<p>I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipts.</p> <p>Contract Administrator: <i>[Signature]</i></p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p>Manager of Procurement: <i>[Signature]</i></p>											

Material Sh. Text Qty. In Base Unit	Item No.	Quot.:	New Flyer	Bearings & industrial	Neopart	Daimler	Nabi	Prevost	Gillig	Muncie	MCI
		Bidder:	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062
		Coil. No.:									
2510-320-0009	10	Val.:	1,284.10								6,299.50
PEDAL ASSY-ACU/BRK,		Price:	128.41	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	629.95
10 EA		Rank:	1								2
2530-070-1014	16	Val.:	2,418.13				2,369.11	2,527.00	2,521.49	2,374.81	3,053.30
RADIUS ROD ASSY LOWER		Price:	127.27	no price	no price	no price	124.69	133	132.71	124.99	160.7
19 EA		Rank:	3				1	5	4	2	6
2530-070-1015	17	Val.:	2050.56				non responsive	2,256.00		non responsive	2,516.64
RADIUS ROD ASSY UPPER		Price:	128.16	no price	no price	no price	2,008.80	141	no price	1,999.84	157.29
16 EA		Rank:	3				2	4		1	5
2930-167-0002	39	Val.:	7,557.52				non responsive			non responsive	
BELT-FAN, JACKSHAFT TO		Price:	111.14	no price	no price	20,618.96	no price	no price	8,735.28	no price	12,281.48
68 EA		Rank:	1			303.22	no price	no price	128.46	no price	180.61
4810-300-0006	46	Val.:	15,502.74					18,338.40		16,892.27	23,636.16
VALVE ASSEMBLY-SOLENOI		Price:	94.78	no price	no price	no price	no price	64.8	no price	59.69	83.52
283 EA		Rank:	1					3		2	4
6220-001-0491	50	Val.:	121.48		122.4		121.96	132.8	125	132.44	177.68
LAMP ASSY-LED, AMBER,S		Price:	30.37	no price	30.6	no price	30.49	33.2	31.25	33.11	44.42
4 EA		Rank:	1		3		2	6	4	5	7
<p>I certify that I have personally opened the bids and I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p><i>[Signature]</i> Contract Administrator</p>											

Material Sh. Text Qty. in Base Unit	Item No.	Quot.:	Gillig	Bearings & Industrial	Neopart	Daimler	Nabl	Prevost	New Flyer	Muncie	MCI
		Bllder:	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062
		Coll. No. :									
2530-077-0028	18 EA	18 Val.:	407.16		533.7		784.62	604.8		358.02	462.06
END ASSEMBLY, TIE ROD		Price:	22.62	no price	29.65	no price	43.59	33.6	no price	19.89	25.67
		Rank:	2		4		6	5		non responsive	3
4810-025-004B	45 EA	45 Val.:	477.3			488.55	583.8	486	495	346.5	643.95
VALVE-LEVELING LF		Price:	31.82	no price	no price	32.57	38.92	32.4	33	23.1	42.93
		Rank:	2			4	6	3	5	non responsive	7
5930-051-0011	47 EA	47 Val.:	13,937.45				20,669.15	23,702.50	26,026.20	22,070.40	16,798.85
SWITCH-BATTERY DISCONN		Price:	146.71	no price	no price	no price	217.57	249.5	273.96	232.32	176.83
		Rank:	1				4	5	6	3	2

[Signature]
 I have personally read all bids received by the time set for receipts.
 Contract Administrator I

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.
[Signature]
 Manager of Procurement

Material Sh. Text Qty. in Base Unit	Item No	Quot: Bidder: Coll. No.:	Prevost IB1100062	Bearings & Industries IB1100062	Daimler IB1100062	Nabi IB1100062	Gillig IB1100062	New Flyer IB1100062	Muncie IB1100062	MCI IB1100062
2510-167-0033 BLIND ASM-DRIVERS WIND 5 EA	7 Val.: Price: Rank:	395.5 79.1 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	432.35 86.47 3	no price	412.45 82.49 2	593 118.6 4
2510-167-0034 BLIND ASM-WINDSHIELD,L 24 EA	8 Val.: Price: Rank:	2,133.12 88.88 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	2,160.00 90 5	no price	2,398.80 99.95 3	3,082.32 128.43 4
2510-380-0002 CYLINDER-AIR, BIPART D 8 EA	11 Val.: Price: Rank:	2,280.00 285 2	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	1,910.00 238.75 1	2,671.84 333.98 3
2520-019-0011 KIT-UNIVERSAL JOINT 6 EA	14 Val.: Price: Rank:	354.96 59.15 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	373.5 62.25 2	no price	496.14 82.69 3	548.46 91.41 4
2815-070-0047 PULLEY-IDLER 16 EA	33 Val.: Price: Rank:	440 27.5 2	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	337.28 21.08 1	1,065.12 66.57 3
2930-012-0042 PUMP-RECOVERY 19 EA	35 Val.: Price: Rank:	1,829.70 96.3 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	2,553.41 134.39 2	3,570.10 187.9 3	2,601.48 136.92 3
2960-015-0007 VALVE ASM-PURGE, AIR D 7 EA	40 Val.: Price: Rank:	454.3 64.9 1	no price	no price	no price	no price	572.34 74.62 3	498.05 71.15 2	530.25 75.75 2	600.25 85.75 5
<p>I certify that I have personally developed and reviewed all bids received by the time set for receipts.</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p>Signature: <i>[Handwritten Signature]</i> Title: Manager of Procurement</p>										
			Contact Administrator							

Material Sh. Text Qty. in Base Unit	Item No	Quot. Bidder: Coll. No. :	Nabi IB1100062	Bearings & industrie Neopart IB1100062	Daimler IB1100062	Prevost IB1100062	Gillig IB1100062	New Flyer IB1100062	Mundle IB1100062	MCI IB1100062
2560-005-0001	28	Val: 743.34	856.7	904.8	831.87	801.06	752.05	1,639.82		
MONITOR-ELECTRICAL SYS		Price: 57.18	no price	69.6	63.99	61.62	57.85	no price		
13 EA		Rank: 1	5	6	4	3	2			
2930-167-0001	38	Val: 697.95	717.75	2,415.60		800.25	3,540.57	7,199.28	2,682.24	
BELT-FAN, CRANK TO JAC		Price: 21.15	no price	73.2	no price	24.25	107.29	218.16	81.28	
33 EA		Rank: 1	2	4	3	6				
<p>I certify that I have personally opened all sealed bids received by the time set for receipts.</p> <p><i>[Signature]</i> Contract Administrator</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p> <p><i>[Signature]</i> Manager of Procurement</p>										

Material Sh. Text	Item No.	Quot.:	Bearings & Industries	Neopart	Nabl	Prevost	Gillig	New Flyer	Muncie	MCI
Qty. in Base Unit	Dairler IB1100062	Coll. No.:	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062
2510-024-0019	5,936.00	2 Val.:	no price	no price	5,956.16	6,608.00	6,339.20	6,077.12	5,620.16	7,318.08
PIN & BUSHING CARTRIDG	26.59	Price:			26.59	29.5	28.3	27.13	25.09	32.67
224 EA	2	Rank:			3	6	5	4	1	7
2530-358-0001	347.76	23 Val.:	431.48		367.08	386.4	12,715.78	489.44	415.38	402.5
SEAL-OIL, HUB CAP, FRO	1.08	Price:	1.34 no price		1.14	1.2	39.49	1.52	1.29	1.25
322 EA	1	Rank:			2	3	8	7	5	4
2710-006-0057	538.34	31 Val.:								
FILTER-HVAC, UNDERFLOOR	24.47	Price:	no price	no price	1,193.50	no price	867.9	no price	no price	584.1
22 EA	1	Rank:			54.25	no price	39.45	no price	no price	26.55
2710-042-0001	685.09	32 Val.:								
FILTER, MINDER, 20"	8.71	Price:	no price	no price	no price	no price	no price	11.06	no price	1,060.18
79 EA	1	Rank:						2		13.42
<p>I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipts.</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.</p>										
										Manager of Procurement

Material Sh. Text	Item No	Quot. Bidder:	Neopart	Bearings & Industrial	Daimler	Nabl	Prevost	Gillig	New Flyer	Muncie	MCI
Qty. in Base Unit		Coll. No. :	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062	IB1100062
2930-111-0004	37	Val:	3,355.20	5,075.04		5,590.56	4,008.00			5,619.36	4,673.28
TENSIONER-FAN BELT, MC		Price:	69.9	105.73	no price	116.47	83.5	no price	no price	117.07	97.36
48 EA		Rank:	1	4		5	2			6	3
4720-091-0142	43	Val:	41.9				72			90.38	68.68
HOSE ASSEMBLY-FILTER I		Price:	20.95	no price	no price	no price	36	no price	no price	45.19	34.34
2 EA		Rank:	1				3				2
4720-036-0133	44	Val:	218.5				246			568	640.2
HOSE ASSY-20,A/C DISCH		Price:	43.7	no price	no price	no price	49.2	no price	no price	113.6	128.04
5 EA		Rank:	1				2			3	4
<p>I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipts. <i>[Signature]</i> Contract Administrator I</p> <p>I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein. <i>[Signature]</i> Manager of Procurement</p>											