

METROPOLITAN TRANSIT AUTHORITY
ABSTRACT

DESCRIPTION: PURCHASE OF POLICE AND
SUPPORT VEHICLES

IFB NO. IB1200006

BID OPENING: 1-11-2012 TIME: 2:00PM

RECORDED BY: PRINSELLA ABBS

NO	NAME AND CITY OF BIDDERS	ITEM NO.	ITEM NO.	ITEM NO.	ITEM NO.	ITEM NO.	ITEM NO.	REMARKS
		1 POLICE PATROL VEHICLES	2 FULL SIZE AUTOMOBILES	3 1/2 TON REG. CAB PICKUP TRUCKS	4 COMPACT CARGO VANS	5 POLICE PRISONER TRANSPORT VAN	6 LIGHT DUTY BUCKET TRUCK	
		UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	
1.	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET CALDWELL, TX	\$31,886.00	\$18,726.00	\$16,375.00	NO BID	\$34,976.00	NO BID	
2.	CALADWELL COUNTRY FORD CALDWELL, TX	NO BID	\$19,557.00	\$15,844.00	\$19,748.00	\$36,116.00	\$91,775.00	
3.	PHILPOTT MOTORS LTD PHILPOTT FORD PORT NECHES, TX	\$28,158.00	\$19,823.00	\$15,289.00	\$19,970.00	\$31,577.00	\$95,305.00	
4.	GRAPEVINE DODGE CHRYSLER JEEP GRAPEVINE, TX	\$28,619.00	\$18,556.00	NO BID	\$19,784.00	NO BID	\$96,021.00	
5.	TOMMIE VAUGHN MOTORS INC. HOUSTON, TX	\$28,137.00	\$21,115.00	\$15,747.00	\$19,351.00	\$31,743.00	\$92,091.00	
6.	CLASSIC CHEVROLET-SUGAR LAND SUGAR LAND, TX	\$31,920.00	NO BID	\$17,647.06	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
7.								
8.								
9.								
10.								

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Contract Administrator

Manager of Procurement