

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

Material		Quot.:	6000000090	6000000096	6000000095	6000000092	6000000091	6000000093	6000000094
Sh. Text		Bidder:	Curved Glass Dist.	MCI	All Pro Windshield	Neopart	New Flyer	Daimler	Gillig
Qty. in Base Unit		Coll. No.:	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005
2510-048-0331	Item 5	Val.:	9,024.00	12,395.78					
WINDSHIELD, RH & LH RE		Price:	96	131.87	19,646.00	no bid	no bid		no bid
94 EA		Rank:		1	2			No bid	
						3			
2510-048-0331	Item 5	Val.:	9,306.00	13,015.24					
WINDSHIELD, RH & LH RE		Price:	99	138.46	19,646.00	no bid	no bid		no Bid
94 EA		Rank:		1	2			NO bid	
						3			
Total Quot.		Val.:	\$18,330.00	\$25,411.02	\$39,292.00				
		Rank:		1	2				
						6			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator I

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

FINAL BID ABSTRACT

Material		Quot.	600000093	600000090	600000095	600000096	600000091	600000092	600000094
Sh. Text		Bidder:	DAIMLER	CURVED GLASS DIST.	ALL PRO WINDSHIELD	MCI	NEW FLYER	NEOPART	GILLIG
Qty. In Base Unit		Coll. No.:	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005
2510-048-0348	Item 8	Val.:	1,894.34	2,240.00	3,976.00				
WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE W		Price:	135.31	160	284	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14 EA		Rank:		1	2	3			
2510-048-0348	Item 8	Val.:	1,894.34	2,380.00	3,976.00				
WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE W		Price:	135.31	170	284	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14 EA		Rank:		1	2	3			
2510-048-0350	Item 9	Val.:	1,753.44	2,080.00	3,692.00				
WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE		Price:	134.88	160	284	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13 EA		Rank:		1	2	3			
2510-048-0350	Item 9	Val.:	1,753.44	2,210.00	3,692.00				
WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE		Price:	134.88	170	284	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
13 EA		Rank:		1	2	3			
Total Quot.		Val.:	7,295.56	8,910.00	15,336.00				
		Rank:		1	2	3			

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

Contract Administrator

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

Manager of Procurement

Material	Quot.:	600000092	600000090	600000096	600000091	600000095	600000094	600000093
Sh Text	Bidder:	Neopart	Curved Glass	MCI	New Flyer	All Pro WindShield	Gillig	Daimler
Qty. In Base Unit	Coll. No :	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005	IFBMM12005
2510-048-0267	Val.:	7,996.80	8,652.00	11,570.16	8,472.24	18,312.00		
WINDSHIELD-CURBSIDE, R	Price:	95.2	103	137.74	100.86	218	No bid	No bid
84 EA	Rank:		1	3	4	2	5	5
ITEM 1								
2510-048-0267	Val.:	8,395.80	9,072.00	12,148.08	8,895.60	18,312.00		
WINDSHIELD-CURBSIDE, R	Price:	99.95	108	144.62	105.9	218	No bid	no bid
84 EA	Rank:		1	3	4	2	5	5
ITEM 1								
2510-048-0268	Val.:	7,330.40	7,931.00	10,605.98	7,766.22	16,786.00		
WINDSHIELD-ROADSIDE (5	Price:	95.2	103	137.74	100.86	218	No bid	No bid
77 EA	Rank:		1	3	4	2	5	5
ITEM 2								
2510-048-0268	Val.:	7,696.15	8,316.00	11,135.74	8,154.30	16,786.00		
WINDSHIELD-ROADSIDE (5	Price:	99.95	108	144.62	105.9	218	No bid	No bid
77 EA	Rank:		1	3	4	2	5	5
ITEM 2								
2510-048-0335	Val.:	431.1			491.58	837		
WINDSHIELD - CURB SIDE	Price:	143.7	no bid	No bid	163.86	279	No bid	No bid
3 EA	Rank:		1			2	3	3
ITEM 6								
2510-048-0335	Val.:	452.7			540.75	837		
WINDSHIELD - CURB SIDE	Price:	150.9	no bid	No bid	180.25	279	No bid	No bid
3 EA	Rank:		1			2	3	3
ITEM 6								
2510-048-0336	Val.:	1,005.90			1,147.02	1,988.00		
WINDSHIELD - STREET SI	Price:	143.7	no bid	No bid	163.86	284	No bid	No bid
7 EA	Rank:		1			2	3	3
ITEM 7								
2510-048-0336	Val.:	1,056.30			1,261.75	1,988.00		
WINDSHIELD - STREET SI	Price:	150.9	no bid	No bid	180.25	284	No bid	No bid
7 EA	Rank:		1			2	3	3
ITEM 7								
Total QuotL	Val.:	34,365.15	61,211.00	70,870.98	92,382.16	130,474.00		
	Rank:	1	2	3	4	5	6	6

I certify that I have personally opened and read all bids received by the time set for receipt.

*[Signature]*  
Contract Administrator I

I have reviewed and verified the prices stated herein.

*[Signature]*  
Manager of Procurement